Result:3-1-5 Time: 29.18 Distances: 7 -6

Lot |Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 IDaIcash Croker Evaw Evch 700 700 yes
2 3 |Da Rebel Kiwi Faw Ald 1800 1800 yes
3 5 Peeping Fawn Slaw Ran on No bid
Heat 2 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.88 Distances: 2.5 - 0.50
Lot ([Trap |[Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
3) 1 [Monearla Cindy Evaw Ranon  [1000 550 no
6 3 Fionntra Crystal [Blk 1 ran on No bid
7 3) Tullovin rose Faw Blk 1 No bid
Heat 3 Result:3-1-5 Time: 29.31 Distances: 9 - 7
Lot |Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 1 Royal Daylight Evaw Evch No bid
10 3 {Hows the tout Faw Ald 1000 900 yes
11 5 Steeple Rd Lola Slaw Out Not put IUp for sale
Heat 4 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.63 Distances: 10 - dist.
Lot ([Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
12 1 |Dalcash Dan Evaw Ran on No bid
13 3 Creggane Savings Faw k.o 550 550 yes
14 5 Strand Reta Slaw ran on 300 300 yes
Heat 5 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.82 Distances: nk - 2
Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
15 1 Rathglasin Crow Evaw Evch No bid
16 3 \Walkthisway Slaw finwl 700 700 yes
17 3) Tullovin Magic Evaw ranon {300 300 yes
Heat 6 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.56 Distances: 4 - 3
Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks |Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N




18 1 |High Interest Evaw Outp 600 300 no
19 3 Flyaway Budgie Faw Ald 550 550 yes
20 5 Rabbits House Evaw Ran on No bid
Heat 7 Result:1-3- Time: 29.22 Distances: 8 - 5
Lot |[Trap |Name Split |Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
21 [1 |Bens County Faw Ald 1650 1650 yes
22 13 Coolaclarig Boy Evaw Ran on No bid
23 B Talavara Bud Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 8 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.09 Distances: 2-6
Lot |[Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 1 |[Kilmessan Jewel Faw Ald 6000 2400 no
25 3 Orange Bluey Evaw Finwl  [3000 No bid
26 5 Kefcar Wonder Evaw Evch 100 100 yes
Heat 9 Result: 51 - 3 Time: 29.84 Distances: 1 - 3
Lot |Trap [Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
27 1 Tullovin blossom Evaw Finwl No bid
28 3 |Doka Charlie Evaw Evch 350 350 yes
30 5 Quarrymount Gem Evaw Ranon [750 750 yes
Heat 10 Result: 5—1 -3 Time: 30.20 Distances: 0.50 - 1
Lot |Trap |[Name Split |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 1 |Dazzlem Denise |Blk Ran on 550 550 yes
34 3 Orange Kathleen |Blk Ran on No bid
35 5 \Vito Peggy Evaw Ran on 600 600 yes
Heat 11 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 30.07 Distances: 0.50 - 0.50
Lot |Trap |[Name Split |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 IKefcar Flight |Ld 3 Ranon 350 350 yes
37 3 |Doka Diana Evaw Ran on No bid




38 5 Amys Cola Evaw Evch Not put |Up for sale
Heat 12 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.2+ Distances: 4 - 2
Lot |[Trap |Name Split  |Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
42 1 Islandea Lady Faw Ran on 2000 1100 yes
43 3 |Kefcar Pearl Slaw FinwlI No bid
44 3) Raymonds Dolly Evaw Finwl No bid
Heat 13 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 28.92 Distances: 0.50 - 10
Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
45 1 \Vito Blackie Faw Evch 2300 2300 yes
A7 3 Fastaway Jack Evaw Ranon No bid
48 5 Spare The Air Evaw Finwl 5000 2600 no
Heat 14 Result:1-3-5 Time: 29.76 Distances: 5- 7
Lot |[Trap [Name Split |Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
49 1 [Borris Eoin Faw Ald Not put IUp for |[sale
50 3 Islandea Bill Evaw Evch 550 550 yes
52 |5 Kefcar Glenda Slaw Nvsh No bid
Heat 15 Result: 4 - 2 Time:29.55 Distances: 5
Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
53 2 ILetter Box Lady Evaw Evch Not put IUp for sale
55 4 |Bangers Vieri Evaw Finwl NO BID
Heat 16 Result: 4 - 2 Time: 29.20 Distances: 10
Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
56 2 Oola Joe Faw Faded Not put IUp for [sale
58 4 Rushaun Flyer Evaw Finwl No bid

Heat 17 Result: 2 - 4 Time:17.31 Distances: 1




Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

0 2 [Ballynanty Lady No bid

41 4 Garryowen Angel Not put {Up for sale

Heat 18 Result: 2 - 4 Time: 16.87 Distances: 10

Lot |Trap |[Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Shaunas Cry No bid
59 4 |[Demoniser 300 300 yes

Heat 19 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 20 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap |[Name Split  [Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 21 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap [Name Split |Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 22 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N




Heat 23 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 24 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap [Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 25 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap [Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 26 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 27 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |Trap [Name Split  |Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N




Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap [Name Split |Remarks Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 30 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap |[Name Split  |[Remarks |Reserve |Bid Sold Y/N




Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot |[Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot |[Trap [Name Split  |[Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale




