
Clonmel Greyhound Stadium Sales - Saturday 25th August

HEAT 1 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.61 Distances: 5l & 5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

1 1 Early Whistle 3.00 E,Bmp1 200 Y
2 3 Vancouver Earl 3.00 Rl,Bmp 1 600 Y
3 5 Roseville Pixie 2.94 Faw,Ald 3000 800 N

HEAT 2 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.71 Distances: 2l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

4 2 Hypnotic Eyes 2.96 Ep,Ld1 750 Y
7 4 Eastern Countess 3.26 Stbtps,Finwl 1150 Y
8 6 Active Kewell 2.96 Ep,Fd 350 Y

HEAT 3 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.55 Distances: 1l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

9 1 Egans Fancy 3.20 Slaw,A3rd 450 Y
10 3 Hypnotic Storm 2.96 Ep,Finwl 1500 Y
11 5 Have The Knack 2.96 Ep,Ldbs 1500 800 N

HEAT 4 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.53 Distances: 3l & 9l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

13 2 Glory Munster 3.03 Bmp1,Ldbs 650 Y
14 4 Little Legacy 3.05 Bmp1,Finwl 1500 Y
16 6 Knocknaboha Cat 2.98 Ep,Fd 100 Y

HEAT 5 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.73 Distances: 1.5l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

17 1 Crackator Bizzy 2.98 Ep,Bmp1 700 Y
18 3 Classy Pilot 3.00 Bmp1,Fd NOT PRESENTED
20 5 Tinsley Kelly 2.94 Faw,Ald 550 Y

HEAT 6 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.88 Distances: 0.5l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

21 2 Doon Beech 3.12 Slaw,A3d 400 Y
23 4 Lyons Fortune 3.01 Ep,Finwl NOT PRESENTED
28 6 Tinsley Bill 2.94 Faw,Hldon 1150 Y

HEAT 7 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.86 Distances: 4l & 5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

30 1 Doubtful Joe 3.07 Ep,Ld2 900 Y
32 3 Bregawn Cindy 3.01 Ep,Blk1 200 Y
35 5 Petite Megan 3.05 Blk1,A3rd 1500 600 N
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HEAT 8 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.38 Distances: 1l & 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

37 2 Charity Polly 3.05 Evaw,A3rd 500 NO BID
40 4 Giglis Gringo 3.05 Evaw,Ldbs 850 Y
39 6 Lisnakill Gussy 3.18 Slaw,Finwl 2600 Y

HEAT 9 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.38 Distances: 2l & 3l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

42 1 Cruising Gamble 3.06 Bmprup,A3rd 500 NO BID
73 3 Madra Dia 2.96 Bmprup,Ldbs 1200 300 N
45 5 Seven Point Lark 2.94 Slaw,Ld4 900 Y

HEAT 10 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.71 Distances: Hd & Hd
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

46 2 Giglis Wok 2.89 Qaw,Blk1 2000 800 N
48 4 Dry Wine 3.04 Slaw,SUS NOT PRESENTED
49 6 Lisnakill Nicky 2.89 Blk1,Finwl 2500 1200 N

HEAT 11 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.62 Distances: 1l & 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

50 1 Rural Amy 2.99 Blk1,Finwl 500 300 N
51 3 Joeys Girl 2.95 Ep,Ldbs 1200 600 N
53 5 Lowlow Lady 3.01 E,Blk1 500 300 N

HEAT 12 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.91 Distances: 4l &4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

54 2 Credit Note 3.00 Blk1,Rnon 300 Y
55 4 Aherlow Rumble 2.87 Qaw,Ald 300 Y
56 6 Doon angel 2.96 Ep,Blk1 NO BID

HEAT 13 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.35 Distances: 8l & Hd
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

60 1 Old Story 3.02 E,Ald 1600 Y
62 3 Aherlow Max 3.02 E,Rnon 500 NO BID
61 5 Balintore Ann 3.05 E,Fdri 750 NO BID

HEAT 14 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.96 Distances: 14l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 



64 2 Rachels Delight 3.19 Slaw,Ck1 200 Y
65 4 Splash About 3.01 Faw,Ald 200 Y
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HEAT 15 Result: 6-4 Time: 29.76 Distances: 1l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

70 4 Keane Whisper 2.97 Ep,Fdri 400 Y
67 6 Balintore Best 2.98 Wbnds,Finwl 800 Y

HEAT 16 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.44 Distances: 3l & 3l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

72 1 Local Holly 3.12 Slaw,A3rd NOT PRESENTED
75 3 Snowey Yank 3.01 Rl,Finwl 1000 NO BID
76 5 Diva Time 2.95 Ep,Ld2 800 Y

HEAT 17 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 28.90 Distances: 6l & 8l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

80 2 Minglers Minor 2.95 Ep,A3rd 150 Y
81 4 Kiltrea Ville 2.90 Qaw,Ald 5000 1200 N
78 6 Gerpats Shadow 2.92 Qaw,A2nd 4000 1000 N

HEAT 18 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.50 Distances: 6l & 1l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

83 1 Rabras Fountain 3.04 Slaw,Rnon 450 Y
84 3 Elite Woody 2.94 Blk1,Finwl 1500 800 N
85 5 Kilkenny Jingle 2.96 Blk1,Fd 800 300 N

HEAT 19 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.33 Distances: 7l & 4l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

86 2 Design Patch 3.00 E,Finwl 1500 500 N
88 4 Kiltrea Classic 2.95 Ep,Fd 1000 NO BID
87 6 Minglers Cool 2.86 Faw,Ald 2000 Y

HEAT 20 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.34 Distances: 11l & 2l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

90 1 Brave Senior 3.00 Bmp1,Finwl 1850 Y
92 3 Minglers Brush 3.02 E,Bmp1 500 Y
91 5 Maughera Beauty 2.96 Ep,Fd 500 NO BID



HEAT 21 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.11 Distances: 5l & 5l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

93 2 Sheeraghs Honcho 2.93 Faw,Ald 3000 1600 N
94 4 Mandeville Rebel 3.01 Ep,A3rd 500 NO BID
96 6 Fairbrook Honcho 3.01 Ep,A2nd 1500 400 N
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HEAT 22 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.19 Distances: 8l & 8l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

98 1 Chloes Verdict 3.21 Slaw,A3rd 800 NO BID
102 3 Bonmahon Dora 2.99 Ep,A2nd 200 Y
103 5 Crackator Senna 2.97 Ep,Finwl 2100 Y

HEAT 23 Result: 2-4 Time: 29.20 Distances: 6l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

106 2 Woodenstown Hero 2.91 Qaw,Ald 1100 Y
108 4 Crackator Button 3.01 Slaw,Rnon 600 Y

HEAT 24 (550) Result: 1-3-5 Time: 30.66 Distances: 3l & 3l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

34 1 Seven Point Lady 4.29 Ep,Ald 2000 400 N
73 3 Minglers Flight 4.31 Ep,Finwl 1000 300 N

110 5 Kilkenny Woods 4.39 Slaw,A3rd 400 Y

HEAT 25 (300) Result: 6-2-4 Time: 16.91 Distances: 3l & 1l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

25 2 Knocknaboha Icy Ep,A2nd 100 Y
66 4 Doon Robin Slaw,A3rd 500 NO BID
52 6 Assalula Alva Faw,Ald 300 Y

HEAT 26 (300) Result: 4-2 Time: 16.59 Distances: 3l
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 

31 2 Knocknaboha Hugh Ep,A2nd 300 Y
68 4 Kilkenny Carisma Faw,Ald 1000 500 N

HEAT 27 (750) Result: 3-5 Time: 43.56 Distances: Hd
Lot Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold 



5 3 Thatchy Mona 14.86 Ep,Finwl 500 Y
97 5 Carlsbush Boy 15.05 slaw,Rnon 500 Y


