Heat 1 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.62 Distances : 1L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Clongeel Teddy 3.56 | Ep,Cmag €1,250 Yes

2 4 Belvoir Show 3.69 | Ldbs, Evch €400 Yes

3 6 Runway Three 3.54 | Qaw, W1 NoBid | NO

Heat 2 Result: 2-4-6 Time : 29.49 Distances : 3L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Serenas Pearl 3.55 | Stbtp,Finwl 4,000 1,400 No

5 4 Jakesofthealley 3.48 | Qaw,Ld €400 Yes

6 6 Corrig Siog 3.65 | Slaw,Rnon No Bid | NO
Heat 3 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.59 Distances: 5L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 2 Match Me 3.62 | Evaw,Crd No Bid | NO

12 4 Fleetwood Murph 3.66 | Mid,Finwl 1,500 1,000 NO

13 6 Payday Eve 3.62 | Evaw,Bmp 1 €500 Yes
Heat 4 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.07 Distances: 6L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 2 Belvoir Molly 3.63 | Evaw, Rnon €600 Yes

15 4 Drompark Access 3.51 | Qaw, Styon €4,000 Yes

17 6 Corrig Cinders 3.68 | Slaw,A3rd No Bid €550 Yes SOB
Heat 5 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.47  Distances: 2I,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
19 2 Victory Mandela 3.52 | Qaw,Hldon €1,500 | Yes

20 4 Dooneen Belle 3.64 | CrdRu,Chl €1,000 Yes

21 6 Climate Jack 3.59 | Evaw,CIrRn No Bid | No

Heat 6 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.33 Distances:  1L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
22 2 Coom Tom 3.50 | Qaw,HIdOn €1,00 Yes

23 4 Belvoir Dreamer 3.54 | Qaw,Rnon €450 Yes

25 6 Shale Jackie 3.65 | Slaw,Chlri 2,000 €1,100 No

Heat 7 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.82 Distances: NKk,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
26 |2 Took The Black 3.56 | Ld 2,HdNrl 500 No

29 |4 Lagile Soviet 3.59 | Rnon,Ldnrl €300 Yes

30 (6 Nowstopthere 3.51 | Qaw,Ld No Bid | No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 2-4-6  Time: 29.44 Distances: 0.5L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Dooneen Classic 3.64 | Slaw,LdNrl 700 No

33 4 Pluckanes Dasher 3.39 | BlkRu,Hdnrl | 2,500 800 No

35 6 Beanos Cathmar 3.58 | Evaw,BmpRu No Bid | No

Heat 9 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.45 Distances: 0.5L, 12L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 2 Two Spots Holly 3.66 | CIrRn,StyW1 | 2,500 1,500 No

38 4 Sportmans Cash 3.63 | Slaw,Crd 1 €300 Yes

39 6 Honey Warrior 3.57 | Qaw,Chlri €1,000 | Yes

Heat 10 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.10 Distances: 2L,8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
40 2 Springwood Maid 3.53 | Mid,Chl 2,000 750 NO

42 4 Caring Climate 3.50 | Ep,Fd No Bid | No

43 6 Hondo Boy 3.48 | Qaw,Styon €2,000 | Yes
Heat 11 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.33 Distances: 10L,1L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
44 2 Whitethorn Sally Bmpru,Fd No Bid | No

45 4 Sportmans Rooney Bmpru,Stywl €1,650 Yes

46 6 Cottesloe Bawny Evaw,Rnon No Bid | No

Heat 12 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.37 Distances:  3L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
48 2 Boherash Dilemma | 3.67 | Slaw,Finwl 2,000 €900 Yes SOB
49 4 Inchydoney Brook | 3.56 | Ep,Ald €700 Yes

50 6 Lochbo Leo 3.65 | Slaw,Blk 1 * NO
Heat 13 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.27 Distances: 8L, 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
51 2 Springwood Mike 3.64 | Slaw,Rnon €400 Yes

52 4 Ballyverry Cool 3.55 | RIRu,Ald €2,600 | Yes

53 6 Satin Millie 3.62 | Slaw,CIrRn No Bid | No

Heat 14 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.06 Distances: 5L, Nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
55 |2 Matty 3.61 | BmpRu,Rnon €1,200 | Yes SOB
56 4 Cottesloe Go On 3.48 | Qaw,Styon €4,200 | Yes

57 |6 Albert Square 3.59 | Evaw,Crd 2,500 1,200 No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 15 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.05 Distances : 3L,14L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
58 2 Boherash Cathal 3.62 | Mid,Stywl €2,400 Yes

60 4 Caha Blackbird 3.69 | Slaw, A 3rd No Bid | No

63 6 Cannery Row 3.59 | Qaw,Blk 1 €1,000 Yes
Heat 16 Result: 2-6-4  Time: 29.62 Distances: 5L,3L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
66 2 Effernogue Top 3.71 | BmpRu,Rnon €1,000 | Yes

67 4 Aldworth Lark 3.77 | Bmpru,Rnon €450 Yes

68 6 An Seabhac 3.67 | CIrRn,Ld €650 Yes
Heat 17 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.00 Distances: 0.5L,7L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
69 2 Bridge Duke 3.63 | Stywl,LdNrl 1,000 No

71 4 Castlelyons Fred 3.48 | Qaw,HdNrl 1.800 No

72 6 Carrowkeal Owen 3.57 | Evaw,Bmp 1 No Bid | No

Heat 18 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 28.97 Distances: 6L ,5L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
73 2 Pikaldi 3.55 | Ep,Ld 400 No

76 4 Effernogue Sarah 3.57 | Evaw,Crd No Bid | No

77 6 Belindas Jewel (W) 3.62 | Ld 3, Stywl 1,800 €2,000 | YesSOB
Heat 19 Result: 4-6-2 Time : 28.97 Distances : 8L,6L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
78 2 Daleridge Blend 3.70 | Slaw,A 3rd No Bid | No

79 4 Chance To Shine 3.42 | Faw,Ald 1,200 No

82 6 Kilgrogan Mentor 3.65 | Slaw,RnOn €450 Yes

Heat 20 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.83 Distances: 1L,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
86 2 Canadian Jamie 3.61 | Slaw,RnOn No Bid | No

87 4 Effernogue Sam 3.54 | Ep,LdNrl €350 Yes

83 6 Leading Bit 3.38 | Faw,HdNrl €300 Yes
Heat 21 Result: 2-6-4 Time: 28.98 Distances: 7L,12L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
88 |2 Ja Orr 3.46 | Qaw,Ald 5,000 1,200 No

90 |4 Sullane Well 3.55 | Evaw,A 3" * No

92 6 Toremore Shaft 3.51 | Qaw,A 2nd €700 Yes
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Heat 22 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.03 Distances: 8L,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 2 Kittys Memo 3.57 | Evaw,Rnon €450 Yes
94 4 Ashbury Flash 3.54 | Evaw,Rnon * No
96 6 Honey Tiger 3.33 | Faw, Styon 2,300 No
Heat 23 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.16  Distances: 2L, 0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
98 2 Curryhills Smoky 3.56 | Evaw,Rnon 3,000 1,000 No
99 4 Levitator 3.52 | Evaw,Rnon No Bid | No
100 |6 Shift To Gamble 3.38 | Faw,Styon €1,600 | Yes
Heat 24 Result: Solo Time: 18.35 Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Beanos Shaggy Solo No Bid | No
4
6
Heat 25 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 26 Results : Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 27 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
2
4
6
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Heat 29 Result: Time: 0 Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale




