
Heat 1            Result: 2-4-6             Time: 30.41                     Distances : Hd,Nk
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 2 Oakfront Susanna 3.67 Rnon, Hldon €850 Yes

2 4 Effernogue Hell 3.57 Ld 1, Blk 1 €200 Yes SOB

3 6 Clongeel Gamble 3.62 Blk 1, Rnon 600 300 NO

Heat 2            Result: 6-4-2            Time :  29.76                  Distances : 4L,5L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

4 2 Foggy Sky 3.79 Slaw, Rnon * No

5 4 Rushing Rock 3.63 Evaw, Rnon No Bid No

6 6 Geneva Star 3.59 Ald, Rnon €650 Yes

Heat 3            Result:   2-4-6     Time: 29.57                     Distances:    Nk,6L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 2 Cooly Pheasant 3.51 Qaw,HldOn €650 Yes

10 4 Kiln Jill (w) 3.51 Qaw,ChlRi €900 Yes

9 6 Scare Crow (w) 3.77 StbTp,RnOn No Bid No

Heat 4            Result:  4-6-2          Time:   29.25      Distances:     8L,8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 2 Oakfront Trinny 3.81 Slaw, A 3rd €300 Yes SOB

15 4 Sycamore Tide 3.47 Qaw,Stywl €1,350 Yes

16 6 Rushing Aaliyah 3.77 Slaw, A2nd No Bid NO

Heat 5            Result: 2-4-6       Time:  29.74 Distances:    1.5L,10L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 2 Geneva Brave 3.58 Evaw,Rnon 1,500 800 No

18 4 Free Role 3.66 Slaw, FinWl 1,000 300 No
20 6 Airtricity Man 3.68 Slaw, A3rd €300 Yes

Heat 6            Result: 4-6-2     Time:    29.46       Distances:     2L,3L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
21 2 Carbon Rainbow 3.58 Evaw,Rnon No No

22 4 Movealong Tucks 3.61 Ldbs,Stywl €1,250 Yes

23 6 Mileheight Gift 3.51 Qaw,Chl €300 Yes SOB

Heat 7            Result:  6-4-2     Time:    29.72     Distances:     3L,8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Curryhills Strol 3.57 Evaw,Blk 1 No Bid No

25 4 Took The Black 3.59 Blk 1, Rnon No Bid No

28 6 Pama Raider 3.53 Blk 1 RnOn €900 Yes

  * Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8            Result: 2-6-4 Time: 29.49    Distances:  4L,6L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

29 2 Onto Katie 3.60 Ald,StyWl €1,100 Yes

30 4 Victory On Ice 3.65 Wru, Bmp 2 No Bid No

32 6 Movealong Blue 3.72 Slaw,RlRu €2,700 Yes

Heat 9            Result:  2-6-4      Time:  29.90      Distances:     0.5L, 1L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

33 2 Diamond Sara 3.68 Slaw,LdNrl No Bid No

35 4 Sunset Light 3.67 Slaw,RnOn No Bid No

34 6 Sycamore Rush(W) 3.49 Qaw,HdNrl €450 Yes

Heat 10           Result: 4-6-2 Time:  29.30       Distances:    4L,8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

38 2 Super Sport 3.60 Evaw,Fd No Bid No

39 4 Ronto 3.67 Slaw,StyW1 3,000 1,400 No

41 6 Dripsey Fox 3.52 Qaw,Evch €650 Yes

Heat 11           Result: 2-6-4    Time:  29.49      Distances: Nk,3L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

43 2 Fitness Club 3.60 Ld 1, Hldon €750 Yes

44 4 Potentilla 3.62 Evaw,Rnon €300 Yes

45 6 Dundanion Legend 3.65 Rnon,ChlRi €1,250 Yes

Heat 12           Result:  2-6-4               Time:    29.45                Distances:    9L,3L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

46 2 Tanned Sandals 3.54 Qaw,StyWl €1,100 Yes

48 4 Balick Rose 3.61 Evaw,ClrRn No Bid No

47 6 Gally Honcho (w) 3.61 Evaw,ChlRi No Bid No

Heat 13           Result: 6-2-4             Time:  29.24          Distances:    4L,8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

49 2 Early Session 3.49 Qaw,Ld 1 €1,300 Yes

50 4 Geneva Spirit 3.58 Evaw,Rnon No Bid No

51 6 Free Show 3.70 Ld2, StyWl 4,000 1,800 No

Heat 14           Result: 6-4-2                    Time:  29.71            Distances: 1L, 4L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
53 2 Yachi 3.63 Slaw, Rnon €300 Yes

55 4 I Will Linger 3.60 Evch ChlRi €500 Yes
54 6 Mischief Beauty (W) 3.55 Ald, Hldon €350 Yes

* Not Presented for Sale



Heat 15            Result:  6-4-2           Time: 29.42 Distances : Sh, 2L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

57 2 Ballyhank Boyo 3.59 Evaw,Rnon €450 Yes

60 4 Geneva Gaffer (w) 3.55 Qaw,Chlri 1,500 800 No

58 6 Ashville Scholes (w) 3.59 Rnon,Hldon €750 Yes

Heat 16            Result: 4-6-2    Time: 29.07     Distances: 7L,6L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

63 2 Hannah Come Home 3.55 Evaw, ClrRn No Bid No

64 4 Colonial Star 3.41 Faw,Styon 4,000 €2,500 Yes SOB

61 6 Cheeky Star (W) 3.50 Qaw,Rnon No Bid No

Heat 17           Result: 6-2-4              Time: 29.10      Distances: 5L,8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

66 2 Ferryforth Lark 3.59 Evaw,Rnon 4,000 1,000 No

67 4 Finnys Girl 3.67 Slaw, A 3rd No Bid No

68 6 Umera Wood 3.52 Qaw,Ald €2,200 Yes

Heat 18           Result: 2-6-4                   Time: 29.38       Distances: 0.5L,6L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
70 2 Geneva Cruise 3.64 Slaw,Finwl 2,500 1,200 No

71 4 Gallery Boy 3.65 Slaw,Rnon No Bid €200 Yes SOB
72 6 Rosden Fence 3.52 Qaw, ChlRi €1,250 Yes

Heat 19             Result: 4-2-6    Time :  29.49        Distances : 1L,4L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

74 2 Johny Quango 3.49 Qaw,Chlri * No

75 4 Distinctive Edge 3.38 Faw,Hldon €1,850 Yes

76 6 Cloncannon Frank 3.41 Ld2, Crd €300 Yes

Heat 20            Result:   6-4-2                   Time: 29.43    Distances:  1L,0.5L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
78 2 Beardys Aimes 3.55 Evaw, Rnon No Bid No

79 4 Gort Na Madra 3.46 Qaw, Evch No Bid No

82 6 Newport 3.49 Qaw,Finwl 2,000 1,500 No

Heat 21            Result: 6-4-2                Time: 29.35                Distances: 0.5L, Nk
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

83 2 Black Abbey Hawk 3.52 Evaw,Stywl * No

84 4 Sing The Blues 3.49 Qaw,Chlri €800 Yes

86 6 Beardys Kid 3.42 Qaw,Hldon 2,000 1,300 No

* Not Presented for Sale



Heat 22            Result: 6-2-4       Time: 29.42          Distances:  8L,2L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

87 2 Whistlers Pride 3.49 Qaw, Ld No Bid No

91 4 Me Bones 3.62 Slaw,Rnon No Bid No

92 6 Get Out Now 3.52 Mid, StyWl €300 Yes

Heat 23         Result: 4-2-6    Time: 29.09       Distances: 6L, 8L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

93 2 Elldan Supreme 3.60 Slaw,Rnon * No

94 4 Belindas Polly 3.46 Qaw,StyWl €1,400 Yes SOB

96 6 Enyas Express 3.49 Ep,Fd No Bid No

Heat 24           Result: 2-4              Time: 29.70                          Distances: 0.5L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

97 2 Witches Pansy 3.68 BmpRu,Hldon No Bid No

98 4 Gleaming Felix 3.70 BmpRu Evch €400 Yes

6

Heat 25 (330)            Result: 6-4-2                      Time: 18.33             Distances: Nk,5L
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Genuine Pilot Evaw,Rnon No Bid No

69 4 Beardys Katrum Qaw,Chlri No Bid No
73 6 Carbon Speedie Qaw,Hldon No Bid No

Heat 26            Results :                  Time:                           Distances:    
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

2

4

6

Heat 27           Result:                          Time:                  Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

2

4
6

Heat 28                    Result:                   Time:                   Distances:  
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

2

4
6

 Not Presented for Sale



Heat 29            Result:              Time: 0          Distances: 
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat          Result:               Time:                Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale


