
Heat 1            Result: 6-2-4               Time: 29.39                     Distances : Hd & 14L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 2 Glenanore Dude 3.47 Qaw,Hdnrl  €3,000 Yes 

3 4 Loughlea Ragga 3.68 Slaw, A 3rd  No Bid No 

2 6 Butterbridge Nan 
(W) 

3.54 Finwl,LdNrl  €1,000 Yes  

 
Heat 2            Result: 2-6-4             Time :  28.99                   Distances : 6L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 2 Bower Turbo 3.50 Mid, Styon  €5,000 Yes 

6 4 Derrinasafa Echo 3.52 Evaw Crd 1  €400 Yes 

7 6 Sparta Doughnuts 3.47 Qaw, Bmp 1 2,000 1,200 No 

 
Heat 3            Result:   6-2-4      Time: 29.15                     Distances:    2L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 2 Leemount Melody 3.51 Evaw, Rnon  €600 Yes 

9 4 Follyokee 3.59 Slaw,A 3rd  €300 Yes 
10 6 Glenanore Maid 3.46 Ep Hldon  €2,800 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  2-6-4          Time:   29.38      Distances:     6L & 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 2 Bower Valley 3.47 Qaw,Ald  €2,600 Yes  

12 4 Lahana Millie 3.63 Slaw, Nvshw  No Bid No 

14 6 Drive On Paud 3.51 Ep, A 2nd  No Bid No 
 

Heat 5            Result: 2-6-4       Time:  29.59  Distances:    1L, 14L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
15 2 Redrock Canyon 3.62 Ald, Hldon  €1,000 Yes 

16 4 Loughlea Mein 3.70 Slaw, Fd  No Bid No 
17 6 Newline Rebel 3.73 Slaw,Chlri   €1,600 Yes 

 
Heat 6            Result: 2-6-4     Time:    29.14       Distances:     5L, 4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
19 2 Malden Flight 3.58 Mid, Finwl  €1,800 Yes 

20 4 Try Gullane 3.46 Qaw,Ld  €300 Yes 

22 6 Helenas Dasher 3.76 Slaw, Finwl  €600 Yes 
 

Heat 7            Result:  4-2-6     Time:    29.35     Distances:     5L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
24 2 Kilshannig Wong 3.65 Slaw,Rnon  No Bid No 

25 4 Johny Quango 3.69 Slaw, Finwl  * No 

23 6 Corrough Beauty (w) 3.58 Ld,Fd  No Bid No 

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 8            Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.35     Distances:  5L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

27 2 Sparta Mia 3.52 Ep, Fd  €300 Yes  

28 4 Star Quin 3.56 Mid,P  €900 Yes 

29 6 Carrowkeal Dudek 3.40 Faw,Ald  €1,600 Yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  2-6-4       Time:  28.92      Distances:     7L, 8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
30 2 Quarrymount Ara 3.49 Ald,Styon  €4,300 Yes 

31 4 Cronody Becky 3.55 Evaw, A 3rd  No Bid No 

32 6 Springville Way 3.51 Evaw, A 2nd 2,500 800 No 
 

Heat 10           Result: 6-2-4 Time:  29.37       Distances:    4L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
33 2 Came From Carrig 3.45 Qaw,Evch  €900 Yes 

34 4 Helenas Ranger 3.58 Slaw, RnOn  300 NO 

36 6 Cash Breaff 3.48 RnOn, Ld 4  €1,500 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 2-6-4    Time:  29.63      Distances: 1L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
38 2 Buds Bunny 3.48 Ep,W 4  * No 

39 4 Samba Speed 3.63 Slaw, A 3rd  No Bid No 

40 6 Leemount Control 3.46 Qaw,Imp 4  €500 Yes 

 
Heat 12           Result:  2-4-6               Time:    29.24                Distances:     7L,9L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
41 2 Stamford County 3.64 Mid, Styon  €1,000 Yes 

42 4 Senahel Blank 3.57 Evaw, Bmp 1  €450 Yes 

43 6 Springville Tag 3.57 Evaw, Bmp 1 1,000 500 No 
 

Heat 13           Result: 6-2-4             Time:  29.48           Distances:    Nk, 6L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
44 2 Butterbridge Dot 3.79 Stbtp,Crd 4 3,000 €2,100 No 

45 4 Super Fox 3.43 Mid, ChlRi  €400 Yes 

46 6 Makybe Diva 3.42 Qaw,Hldon  €700 Yes 
 

Heat 14           Result: 6-4-2                    Time:  29.50            Distances:  1L, 10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
47 2 Stampofthemother 3.47 Ep, Fd  * No 

48 4 Gooey Lass 3.42 Qaw,Chlri  €1,000 Yes 
50 6 Cronody Katie 3.54 Ld 4, Finwl 2,500 1,500 NO 

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 15            Result:  6-2-4           Time: 29.16  Distances : 6L, Dist 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

51 2 Greenvale Post 3.60 Slaw, Blk 3  €500 Yes 

53 4 Sportsmans Rascal 3.42 Qaw, Blk 3 600 400 No 

52 6 Drive On Chap (w) 3.51 Ld 3, Styon 5,000 €4,000 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 16            Result: 2-6-4    Time: 29.47     Distances: 2L,12L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
54 2 Boola Fortune 3.49 Qaw, Finwl 1,000 800 No 

55 4 Way More Blues 3.51 Evaw, A 3rd  * No 

56 6 Senahel Ben 3.45 Qaw, Bmp 4  €900 Yes 
 

Heat 17           Result: 4-2-6              Time: 29.31      Distances: 2L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
57 2 Belindas Polly 3.71 Slaw, Finwl 1,000 400 No 

58 4 Mountmary Sean 3.45 Ep, Ald  €2,000 Yes 

59 6 Big Mentor 3.50 Evaw,Fd 3,000 500 No 

 
Heat 18           Result: 4-6-2                   Time: 29.47    Distances:  2L,4L  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
61 2 Samba Maybe 3.63 Slaw, Blk 1 500 300 No 

62 4 Shellyanne 3.56 ClrRn, Rnon  €500 Yes 
64 6 Boola Rogue 3.54 Ep, Blk 1 2,000 1,000 No 

 
Heat 19             Result: 4-6-2     Time :  29.51        Distances : 0.5L, 1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 2 Sportmans Eagle 3.70 Slaw, A 3rd  No Bid No 

68 4 Get Out Now 3.60 Mid, Finwl 1,200 800 No 

69 6 Cooly Lane 3.52 Ep, Evch  €700 Yes 
 

Heat 20            Result:   2-6-4                   Time: 29.78    Distances:  0.5L,Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
70 2 Gleaming Gyspsy 3.64 Blk,Finwl 1,200 800 NO 

71 4 Glittering Aries 3.57 Evaw,Blk 1 1,200 700 No 

72 6 Go Up Front 3.57 Evaw,Chlri  No Bid  
 

Heat 21            Result: 4-2-6                Time: 29.48                 Distances:  Nk,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

73 2 Tragumna Traitor 3.67 CrdRu, Chri  €600 Yes  

75 4 Orchard Major 3.58 Ep,Hldon  €800 Yes 

76 6 No Joke Nikita 3.68 Blkru, A 3rd 1,500 1,100 No 

* Not Presented for Sale 
 



Heat 22            Result: 2-4-6         Time: 29.78           Distances:  5L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

78 2 Conna Angel 3.55 Evaw,Finwl  €550 Yes 

80 4 Talavara Breeze 3.51 Ep, Ld  No Bid No 

81 6 Naidines Hero 3.81 MsdBk,A3rd  €700 Yes 

 
Heat 23         Result: 4-2-6    Time: 28.82       Distances: 7L, 10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
82 2 Fiji Major 3.43 Qaw, A 2nd  €1,000 Yes 

83 4 Pride at Stake 3.38 Faw,Styon 3,000 €1,500 Yes SOB 

84 6 Travara Moth 3.65 Slaw, A 3rd  €250 Yes SOB 

 
Heat 24           Result: 4-2-6              Time: 29.19                          Distances: 2L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
86 2 Levitator 3.52 Evaw,Rnon 1,500 900 No 

87 4 Ullid Dinny 3.52 BmpRu,Finwl  €950 Yes 

88 6 Baby Lil 3.49 Qaw,BmpRu 1,400 700 No 

 
Heat 25           Result: 2-4-6                        Time: 29.71                     Distances:  0.5L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
90 2 Corrough Juinor 3.47 Ep,Finwl 1,000 500 No 

91 4 Mams Gold 3.45 Ep,Evch  €400 Yes 
92 6 Gleaming Millie 3.63 Slaw, A 3rd  No Bid No 

 
Heat 26             Results :    6-2-4              Time: 29.61                           Distances:    1L,Nk 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
93 2 Travara Biddy 3.57 Mid, Chlri  €250 Yes SOB 

94 4 Slippery Road 3.47 Ep,Fd  €200 Yes SOB 

95 6 Bearhaven Katie 3.62 Mid,FinWl  No Bid No 
 

Heat 27           Result: 6-4-2                          Time: 29.16                 Distances: 6L,Nk      
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
97 2 Balintore Elm 3.48 Ep,  * No 
98 4 Ullid Kevin 3.48 Ep,  €900 Yes 
99 6 Flyover Lad 3.58 Mid, Finwl 3,000 2,500 No 

 
Heat 28                    Result:  4-6-2                 Time: 29.31                  Distances:  7L,3L     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
100 2 Pavilion Queen  3.47 Evaw,Crd3  * No 
101 4 Kilalla Kewell  3.41 Qaw, Ald  €700 Yes 
103 6 Kilshannig Comet 3.52 Blk 1, Rnon  * No 

• Not Presented for Sale 
 

 



Heat 29 330           Result: Solo             Time:18.50           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 2 Dribs and Drabs 0 Solo  No Bid No 

        
        

 
Heat 30 (750)          Result: 4-2              Time:  43.75              Distances: 3L        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
74 2 Witches Daisy 15.45 Evaw,Rnon  €100 Yes SOB 

85 4 Witches Iris 15.50 Evaw,Rnon  No Bid No 

        
 

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

* No presented for sale 


