
Heat 1            Result:3-5-1        Time:29.68 Distances:  5-8
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 1 Bangers kewell Evaw Evch No bid

2 3 Fandango jane Faw ald 700 700 yes

3 5 Quick Benny Evaw Finwl 1200 1200 yes

Heat 2            Result:  1-5-3  Time:  28.86 Distances:     8-3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

4 1 Vito Rocket Fa Ald 2700 2700 yes

5 3 Rabbits Crash Slaw Ranon 300 300 yes

8 5 Headleys Scholes Evaw Evch 700 700 yes

Heat 3            Result:   5-3-1 Time   28.81     Distances  7-10
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 1 Aisce Slaw Outp No bid

10 3 `Lubagh Queen Evaw ran on 500 500 Yes4300

11 5 Leamanveigh Dubh Faw Finwl 4300 4300 yes

Heat 4            Result: 3-1-5        Time:    29.47         Distances1.5  -  9
Lot  Trap Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 1 Rahmale vet Faw Evch 500 500 yes

13 3 Vito Blue Evaw Finwl 1600 1600 yes

14 5 Quick Mac Slaw outp 500 500 yes

Heat 5            Result:3-5-1       Time:  29.77    Distances:    6-5
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
15 1 Majesterial One Evaw Blk 100 100 yes

16 3 Rockmount Prenup Faw ald 450 450 yes
17 5 Headleys Droopy Evaw Blk 600 600 yes

Heat 6            Result:  1-5-3      Time:  29.52       Distances  3  =  0.50
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
18 1 Fionas Refusal Faw ran on 800 800 yes

21 3 Kings Bounty Faw Evch 400 400 yes

22 5 Scarriff Gypsy Evaw Finwl 500 500 yes

Heat 7            Result:5-1-3     Time: 29.33      Distances:    0.50  -  12
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Lunar Abbey Evaw ran on 1500 500 no

24 3 No Joke Shakira Evaw Outp No bid

25 5 Kilfinny Risk Evaw Finwl 1100 1100 yes



Heat 8            Result:  3-1-5     Time:  29.54       Distances:  dist.,
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

26 1 Bens Mary Lou Evaw Blk 200 200 yes

27 3 Earls Melody Evaw finwl No bid

29 5 Rathronan Toppe Evaw Blk No bid

Heat 9            Result:   3-5-1    Time:     29.26        Distances:     4-7
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

33 1 Seogie Evaw blk 300 300 yes

35 3 Lleyton Star Evaw Finwl 500 500 yes

36 5 Coolboy Express Evaw ran on 300 300 yes

Heat 10           Result:    1-3-5   Time:    29.56         Distances:    3-8   
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

37 1 Carriglawn Joker Faw ald 950 950 yes

38 3 Islandea Rose Eave Finwl 500 500 yes

39 5 Fastaway Kyle Evaw Outp 350 350 yes

Heat 11           Result:  5-3-1        Time:  29.91           Distances:     NK  - 1.5
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

40 1 Balline fantasy Faw Evch No bid

42 3 Eastenders Gold Evaw Evch 300 300 yes

44 5 Alexs Bluey Evaw ran on 300 300 yes

Heat 12           Result:    1-5-3      Time: 29.57          Distances:       1.5  -  3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

45 1 Michaels Mein Evaw ran on 850 850 yes

46 3 Malbay Sid Blk 1 Finwl 1600 1600 yes

48 5 Gortown Premier Evaw Blk Commission only

Heat 13           Result:    1-3-5     Time:     30.53    Distances:     6  -  dist  
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

49 1 Jerjo Blk 1 Ran on 300 300 yes

50 3 Pagoda Boy Blk 1 Ran on No bid

51 5 Lickadoon Blue Ld 1 k/0 No bid

Heat 14           Result: 5-1-3         Time: 28.87       Distances:     7  -  12  
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
52 1 Wizard Gold Evaw ran on 500 500 yes

53 3 Stormy Sinatra Evaw Out No bid
54 5 Society Rebel Faw Finwl 4100 4100 yes



Heat 15            Result: 5-3-1         Time:29.50      Distances: 5  -  3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

55 1 Raymonds Dolly Evaw Blk No bid

56 3 Scattr Show Evaw Ran on No bid

57 5 Old story Faw ran on 1500 1500 yes

Heat 16            Result: 1-5-3         Time: 29.46          Distances: 3  -  10
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

58 1 Malbay Bobby Faw ran on 1000 750 no

60 3 Hilltop ronaldo Blk 1 ran on No bid

63 5 Quick Revenge Blk 1 Outp 650 650 yes

Heat 17           Result: 5-1-3         Time:29.37        Distances: 3  -  3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

64 1 Toems Black Evaw Evch 300 300 yes

65 3 Raymonds Disco Evaw ran on No bid

68 5 Patmoss Faw ran on 900 900 yes

Heat 18           Result:  5-3-1        Time: 29.56         Distances: 2  -  8
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
69 1 Shadow Chantell Slaw Outp No bid

70 3 Guaire Mirage Faw Evch 300 300 yes
71 5 Ventry Vieri Faw ran on No bid

Heat 19           Result: 3-1-5   Time: 28.98         Distances:    4  -  1
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

72 1 Handsome Ranger Evaw ran on 550 550 yes

73 3 Shanavulin Point Faw ald No bid

74 5 Rockmount Bronte Evaw Finwl 300 300 yes

Heat 20           Result: 1-3-5         Time: 29.42         Distances:  7  -  4
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
75 1 Caught Him Evaw ran on 500 500 yes

76 3 Drama Group Faw Faded No bid

78 5 Actspectation Slaw Outp No bid

Heat 21           Result: 1-5-3         Time: 29.31               Distances: 1  -  3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

80 1 Guaire Haze Faw Ald 450 450 yes

83 3 Press On Evaw ran on 1650 1650 yes

86 5 Behans Delia Evaw Ald 650 650 yes



Heat 22            Result:  5-1-3          Time: 29.81          Distances:  1  -  1
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

91 1 Se go Bheara Evaw Ran on No bid

92 3 Ring Back Evaw Evch Not put Up for sale

95 5 Shadow Bengy Evaw ran on Not put Up for q sale

Heat 23            Result: 1-3-5         Time: 16.97          Distances: 5  -  2
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

6 1 Brave Athlacca Faw ald No bid

28 3 Handy Chat No bid

41 5 Sormy Galileo Blk 1 ran on No bid

Heat 24           Result: solo         Time: 40.25                   Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

96 2 Satellite Style Not put Up for sale

Heat 25           Result: 5-1-3                     Time: 16.63                   Distances: 1 - 2
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 1 All right there No bid

66 3 Round Hill bacon Not put Up for sale
79 5 Tally Ho Warrior Not put Up for sale

Heat 26           Result: 4  - 2                    Time: 16.77                  Distances: 10
Lot  Trap name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
82 2 Clonreddan Sue Not put Up for sale

88 4 Redhot Owen No bid

Heat 27           Result: 2  -  4                   Time:    16.58                Distances:        6
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
93 2 Tally Ho Flyit Not put Up for sale

94 4 Call the Joker Not put Up for sale

Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N



Heat 29            Result:              Time:          Distances: 
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:        
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale


