
Heat 1            Result:5-1-3        Time: 29.76 Distances:  1--2
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 1 Newbridge Best Evaw Finwl 650 650 yes

2 3 Il Divo Evaw Ran on No bid

3 5 Coolscart Flight Faw Ald 750 750 yes

Heat 2            Result: 1-3-5   Time:  29.69 Distances:  7--1   
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

4 1 Black Trey Evaw Ran on 750 750 yes

5 3 Harlequin Swift Faw Faded 600 300 no

6 5 Doasiplease Evaw Evch No bid

Heat 3            Result:  5-1-3  Time:  29.78           Distances:      shd   -  1
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 1 Kyle Trussardi Evaw Finwl 800 500 no

10 3 Jerrys Rocket Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes

11 5 Xpert Beauty Evaw Ran on 550 550 yes

Heat 4            Result:   1-5-3          Time: 29.44            Distances:    2  -  6
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
12 1 Torpeys Mai Evaw Finwl 750 750 yes

13 3 No River Evaw Outp 300 300 yes

14 5 Dark Commander Evaw Evch 500 500 yes

Heat 5            Result: 5-3-1           Time:     29.70    Distances:      2.5—1.5
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 1 Bright Mags Slaw Ran on No bid

18 3 Harlequin Arwen Faw Evch No bid

19 5 Ardant Lark Evaw Ran on 500 500 yes

Heat 6            Result:   3-5-1        Time:28.98                 Distances:     7 - 12
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
22 1 Sunrise Silkey Slaw Outp No bid

23 3 Ciaras Winnie Faw Ald 4100 4100 yes

24 5 Night Cap Evaw ran on 1600 1600 yes

Heat 7            Result:   3-1-5        Time: 29.61            Distances:     4--1
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
25 1 Big Break Evaw Finwl 300 300 yes

26 3 Indigenous Faw Ald 750 750 yes

27 5 Sams Shoes Evaw Evch No bid



Heat 8            Result: 3-5-1     Time:  29.36       Distances:  5  -  8
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

28 1 Fionntra Richie Evaw Blk No bid

29 3 Traffic Command Faw Ald 200 2100 yes

31 5 Black Bush Slaw Finwl No bid

Heat 9            Result:  3-5-1     Time:     29.46        Distances:     nk - 10
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

32 1 Mind the Spot Evaw Outp No bid

33 3 Gooseberry Hill FAw heldon 600 600 yes

34 5 Ardant Hill Evaw Finwl 300 300 yes

Heat 10           Result: 1-3-5      Time:    29.35         Distances:       0.50  -  9
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

35 1 Clover Hondo Evaw Ran on 1500 1500 yes

36 3 Yanks Loser Evaw Ranon 1600 1600 yes

37 5 National Custom Slaw Nvsh No bid

Heat 11           Result:  1-5-3        Time: 29.27           Distances:     2.5  -  4
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

38 1 Fairest Dove Faw Ran on 700 700 yes

39 3 Steeple Rd Road Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes

40 5 Good Image Faw Ran on 700 700 yes

Heat 12           Result: 1-3-5          Time: 29.87          Distances:   hd = 3    
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

41 1 Rock Down Susie Evaw Ran on No bid

43 3 Onward and Up Evaw Ran on No bid

51 5 Finnure Fantasy Evaw Evch No bid

Heat 13           Result:  3-5-1       Time:   29.70      Distances:       8-1
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

53 1 Seans Princess Slaw Outp No bid

54 3 Cyrus Dolly Faw Ald 350 350 yes
56 5 Derg Sunset Evaw Outp No bid

Heat 14           Result: 1-5-3         Time: 29.61       Distances:     1.5  -  2.5  
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 1 Parkside Gale Slaw Finwl 1200 1200 yes

59 3 Cragaknock Lane Evaw Evch No bid
60 5 Da rebel Winner Faw Evch No bid



Heat 15            Result:  3-5-1         Time:29.36      Distances: 4-5
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

61 1 Teevee Switch Evaw Ald No bid

62 3 Saras Shakira Evaw Evch 800 800 yes

63 5 Coshlea Breeze Evaw ran on 700 400 no

Heat 16            Result:3-1-5         Time: 29.18          Distances: 5-8
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

65 1 Rockland Nikita Evaw Ran on 350 350 yes

66 3 Granada Trey Faw Ald No bid

68 5 Teevee Spirit Evaw Outp No bid

Heat 17           Result: 1-3-5         Time:28.96        Distances: 5 - 7
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

69 1 Tuscany bound Faw ald No bid

72 3 Dixies Choice Evaw ran on 450 450 yes

73 5 Derg Sunrise Evaw outp No bid

Heat 18           Result:  4 - 2        Time: 29.17         Distances: 14
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
74 2 Cragaknock Cheta Evaw outp Not put up for sale

75 4 Finnure Fairy Faw Ran on 1800 1000 no

Heat 19           Result: 4-2   Time: 29.35         Distances:   3
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

76 2 Barntick boss Evaw Finwl No bid

77 4 Glenard man Faw ald Not put Up for sale

Heat 20           Result: 4  -  2         Time: 16.55         Distances:  7
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 2 Glandore timmy 250 250 yes

16 4 Bee Stinger 300 300 yes

Heat 21           Result:         Time:                 Distances: 
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

44 Slaheny chief Ran on mon 300 300 yes



Heat 22            Result:             Time:          Distances:  
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 23            Result:         Time:          Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 24           Result:         Time:                     Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 25           Result:                      Time:                    Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 26           Result:                     Time:                    Distances:
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 27           Result:                    Time:                    Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N



Heat 29            Result:              Time:          Distances: 
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:        
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:       
Lot  Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale


