Heat 1 Result:5-3-1 Time: 29.07 Distances: 10-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
2 1 Silkey Boots Evaw Evch No bid

3 3 No Connection Evaw Evch 700 700 yes

4 5 Coast Road Man Faw Ald 2000 2000 yes

Heat 2 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.31 Distances: 1-2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
5 1 Clover The Best Slaw Finwl 900 900 yes

6 3 Navigator Faw Faded 2000 400 no

7 5 Amazing Lleyton Evaw Ranon 1600 1600 yes
Heat 3 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.39 Distances: 3-0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
8 1 Who is He Faw Evch 650 650 yes

9 3 Mythical Mike Evaw Finwl 1200 1200 yes

10 5 Bargain Dotty Evaw Ranon | 300 300 yes

Heat 4 Result: 3-5-1 Time:29.38 Distances: 1.5 -0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 1 Safa Prince Slaw finwl 350 350 YES

12 3 Kyle Dancer Evaw Ld 1100 1100 yes

13 5 Handsome Sunrise Faw Evch 1500 1300 yes

Heat 5 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.28 Distances: 6-3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 1 No Fee Evaw Evch 500 500 yes

15 3 Crown Rebel Evaw Ranon | 1000 450 yes

16 5 Headleys Jenny Faw Finwl 2000 1300 no

Heat 6 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 28.96 Distances: 2-4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
18 1 Rith Cinnte Evaw Finwl | 900 900 yes

19 3 Mythical Fortune Faw Ald 3800 3800 yes

20 5 Hard Shell Evaw Evch 500 500 yes

Heat 7 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.76 Distances: hd - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
21 1 Double Echo Faw Finwl 1200 400 no

22 |3 Ballyhannon Lady Slaw Ranon | 300 300 yes

23 |5 Dylans Black Faw Evch 1000 300 no




Heat 8 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.08 Distances: 1-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 1 Smiling Ninja Evaw ran on | 1500 1500 yes

25 3 Dunaree Boy Evaw Ran on | 900 900 yes

26 5 Granada kewell Evaw Ran on | 750 750 yes

Heat 9 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.30 Distances: 5-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
27 1 Handsome Sunset Slaw Ran on | 300 300 yes

28 3 Black Abbey hawk Evaw finwl No bid
29 5 Rathcuala Glen Evaw Evch 600 600 yes

Heat 10 Result: 3-1-5  Time: 29.07 Distances: 4-6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 1 Readers Club Evaw Evch No bid
33 3 Mulcair Pires Faw Ald 2000 2000 yes

34 5 Ballyfolion Well Slaw Ran on | 400 400 yes

Heat 11 Result: 5-1-3 Time:29.31 Distances: 2 -6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
35 1 Spooky Sal Evaw Finwl | 400 400 yes

36 3 Inislosky Tagger Evaw Faded No bid
37 5 Carbon Zola Faw Ald 1300 1300 yes
Heat 12 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.15 Distances: 7-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
38 1 Comogue Rooster Blk 1 Ran on 550 550 yes

40 3 Lagona Blk 1 ran on 2000 700 no

41 5 Tuscany bound Faw ald 3000 1800 no

Heat 13 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.59 Distances: 1.5 - nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 1 Moneygall Penny Slaw Finwl 300 300 yes

44 3 Croker Express Evaw Ran on | 400 400 yes

45 5 Rathmale Steve Evaw Ran on | 500 500 yes

Heat 14 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.15 Distances: hd-5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
46 |1 Jims Spring Pick Evaw ran on No bid
47 |3 Lickadoon Kerry Faw ran on 1600 1600 yes

49 |5 Cragaknock Spice Slaw outp 600 600 yes




Heat 15 Result: 3-1-5 Time:29.14 Distances: 2--5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
50 1 Inislosky Troy Faw Evch No bid
52 3 Ensure Control Evaw Finwl | 750 750 yes

53 5 Ask the Umpire Slaw Ran on | 800 300 no
Heat 16 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.12 Distances: 1--10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 1 Kathryns Hero Evaw Ran on No bid
56 3 Dark Olive Faw Ran on 450 450 yes
57 5 Ballina Prince Evaw Outp 300 300 yes

Heat 17 Result: 1-3-5 Time:29.20 Distances: 1.5 - 7

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
58 1 Right So Sire Faw Ald 450 450 yes
59 3 Koors Girl Evaw Finwl | 600 600 yes
62 5 Bush Survival Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 18 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 19 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 20 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 21 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N




Heat 22 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 23 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 24 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 25 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 26 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 27 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N




Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 30 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale




