Heat 1 Result:5-1-3  Time: 29.80 Distances. 25 - 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 Clonlusk Flash Evaw Evch 500 500 yes

2 Emmas Mentor Evaw Nvsh No Bid
3 5 Glengar Charlie Evaw Finwl 700 700 yes
Heat 2 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 30.17 Distances. 2 - 3

Lot | Trap | NAME Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Stay for Joy Evaw Finwl No Bid
5 3 Blackroad Queen Faw Ald 600 600 yes
6 5 Normans Tuck Evaw Evch 300 300 yes
Heat 3 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 30.59 Distances. 1.5 - 4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 1 Black Abbey Evaw W.1 50 50 yes

8 3 Katies Temper Evaw Blk. 300 300 yes

9 5 Black And Firth Slaw Ld. 1 450 450 yes
Heat 4 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.41 Distances. 8 - 10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 1 Glangar Vic Evaw Outp 1000 400 no

11 3 Enlightment Faw Ald 2000 2000 yes
12 5 A real Madam Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 5 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.18 Distances. 10 - 0.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
13 1 Stay for Luck Evaw Evch 400 400 yes
15 3 Boherbradda mac Viaw Ald 4300 4300 yes
16 5 Glengar Shirley Faw Evch 1000 550 no
Heat 6 Result:1-5-3 Time: 30.36 Distances: 1 - nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
18 1 Sindirana Evaw Evch| 600 350 no

19 3 Leahs Lovelyeyes Evaw Evch No bid
20 5 Derg Dawn Evaw Evch No bid
Heat 7 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 30.29 Distances. 2 - 0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
21 1 Buster Hurricane Faw Evch 700 300 no
22 |3 Glengar Sarah Evaw Finw] 1500 500 no
23 |5 Killeaney Girl Not put Up for| Sale




Lot |Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 Beaming Shadow Evaw Ran pn No bid
27 Twirl About Evaw Outp Not put Up for Sale
28 5 Derg Mist Faw Ranon 550 550 yes
Heat 9 Result: 3-1-5  Time29.62 Distances. 0.50 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
29 1 Chloe Boey Faw Evch 1200 600 yes
30 3 Bypass Blue Faw Ran or 650 650 yes
31 5 Dromlara Tara Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 10 Result: 5-1-3 Time 29.33 Distances. 5 -5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
32 1 Malbay Millie Slaw Finwl 1500 800 no

33 3 Knocktoosh Class Evaw Evch 300 300 yes
35 5 Blue Gate Faw Ran on 4000 4000 yes
Heat 11 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.67 Distances. 14 - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Hurry On Evaw Outp 400 300 no

38 3 Jolly Swagman Faw Ranon 1100 1100 yes
42 5 Doonakenna Spot Evaw outp 200 200 yes
Heat 12 Result: 5-3-1 Time 29.49 Distances. 6 - 12

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
43 1 Tuogh So Black Evaw Outp No bid
44 3 Knockanae Slippy Faw Evch 700 400 yes
45 5 Excitable Black Evaw Finwl 5000 3500 no
Heat 13 Result: 5-1-3 Time 29.75 Distancess 5 -1

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
46 1 Mounthenry Faw Evch 1500 600 no

48 3 Best Tomato Slaw Finwl 500 300 no

50 5 Regional Martin Evaw Finwl| 1600 1300 no
Heat 14 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 30.12 Distances. 3 - 14

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
51 1 Malbay Leon Slaw Finwl 700 700 yes

52 3 Doonakenna Mist Faw Evch No bid
53 5 Tuogh Black Slaw Nvsh No Bid




Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 Dawn Star Evaw Outp Not put Up for Sale
55 Tullig Bridge Faw Evch Not put Up for Sale
56 5 Euro Tiger Faw Finwl 2300 2300 yes
Heat 16 Result 3-1-5 Time: 29.94 Distances: 10 ---8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
58 1 Knocktoosh Kid Evaw Outp 300 300 yes
59 3 Stringers Magic Faw Ald 1500 600 no
60 5 Chapelane Bubble Evaw Outp Not put Up for le sa
Heat 17 Result:5-1-3 Time:30.15 Distances6 - nk

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
61 1 Deans Swift Faw Blk 4 No Bid
62 3 Megans Gift Evaw Blk 3 Not put Up for Sale
63 5 Alone Denise Evaw Rangn 250 250 yes
Heat 18 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.52 Distances. 2- 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
65 1 Euro Leader Faw Ran or 1800 1800 yes
68 3 Mounteagle Vista Slaw Ranon  Not put Up for ales

69 5 Meadow Springs Evaw Faded No bid
Heat 19 Result:3-5-1 Time 29.84 Distances:...5-5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
70 1 Rathronan Girl Blk Ran up No bid
71 3 Coolready Bluey Blk Ran on 300 300 yes
73 5 Star On Water Evaw Ran on 700 400 no
Heat 20 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.71 Distances. 3 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
74 1 Blue Brasso Evaw Ran an 300 300 yes
75 3 Stay for Blackie Faw Ald 700 700 yes
76 5 Mounteagle Yank Evaw Finwl|  Not put Up for] &al
Heat 21 Result:3-5-1 Time: 29.52 Distances. 14 - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
77 1 Ardant Lucy Blk 1 Outp Not put For sale
78 |3 Raymonds Sutty Faw Ald 700 700 yes
79 |5 Rathronan Breeze Blk 1 Outp No bid




Heat 22 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.84 Distances. 8 - 8
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
80 1 Fort Rondo Evaw Outp No bid
82 3 Ventry Velvet Slaw Ran or No bid
84 5 Annasprida Magic Faw Ald 1500 700 no
Heat 23 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.74 Distances. 4 - 0.50
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
85 Coolready Blacky Faw Ran on 400 400 yes
87 3 Readandwilling Evaw Evch Not put Upfor sale
89 5 Tanavalla Rock Slaw Ran op No bid
Heat 24 Result:3-5-1  Time:29.55 Distances. 4 - 7
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
91 1 Fort Bruke Evaw Outp 100 100 yes
92 3 Cross Rocket Faw Ranon 1000 1000 yes
95 5 Loughty Chief Evaw Ran on 600 600 yes
Heat 25 Result Time 41.42 Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
88 2 Cork Blue Bell Evaw Not put Up for] Sale
Heat 26 Result1=5=3 Time: 17.13 Distances. 1 - Dist
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 1 Less Will do Evaw Evch No Bid
37 3 Seanos Pride Slaw Nvsh Not put Up for Sale
41 5 Chapelane Lily Evaw Evch No bid
Heat 27 Result: 4-2 Time 1691 Distances. 1
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
26 2 Betting bonanza No Bid
64 4 Chapelane Droopy No Bid
Heat 28 Result: Time: Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
46 Chapelane Mac Raced Mon 1500 1000 yes
11.12.06

Notes: Result of Heat 8: 5-1-3 29.92 Dist. 6 - Result of Heat 15: 5-3-1 29.46 7 -5




Heat 29 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 30 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N




* No presented for sale




