
Heat 1            Result:3-1-5        Time: 29.34  Distances:   2.5  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

2 1 Bresheen pepper  Evaw Evch 2000 600 no 

3 3 Tullovin Judy  Evaw Finwl 2700 2700 yes 

4 5 Emmas Mentor  Evaw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 2            Result:   5-3-1   Time:   29.79  Distances:     1.5 – 1.5  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 1 Flyer Star  Faw Evch 500 500 yes 

6 3 Glengar Susie  Evaw Ran on   No bid 

7 5 Lady Luckycharm  Slaw finwl 500 500 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result:  3-5-1    Time:   29.16           Distances:      8  -  5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 1 Slaheny chief  Evaw Evch   No bid 

9 3 Joe Matt  Evaw Finwl 2600 2600 yes 
10 5 Balinlee Lass  Evaw Evch   No Bid 

 
Heat 4            Result:   5 – 1 -3           Time: 29.36             Distances: 3  -  1.5     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
11 1 Ferryforth Jo  Evaw Evch 700 700 yes 

13 3 Boherbradda bell  Slaw Ran on 1000 400 no 

14 5 Family Slaney  Faw Ran on 3400 3400 yes 
 

Heat 5            Result: 1-3-5            Time:    29.45     Distances:    8  -  4   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
15 1 Slimfastfrance  Faw Ald 1600 1600 yes 

17 3 Portbe Star  Evaw Evch 550 550 yes 
18 5 Risky Lad  Evaw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 6            Result: 5-1-3           Time:  29.70                Distances:      1 - 5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
19 1 Mildred Street  Faw Evch 300 300 yes 

20 3 I Doubt It  Slaw Evch 500 500 yes 

21 5 Bird in the Sky  Faw Ran on 500 500 yes 
 

Heat 7            Result:  1-3-5          Time:  29.76             Distances:  7  -  5     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
22 1 Gurtnacr3ehy View  Slaw Finwl 1500 800 yes 

23 3 Bangers Road  Evaw Evch   No bid 

24 5 Portbeg Pride  Evaw Evch 500 500 yes 

 



Heat 8            Result: 1-5-3      Time: 29.61         Distances:  7  - 1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

25 1 You Grins  Faw Ran on 700 700 yes 

26 3 Eoins Agassi  Evaw Ran on   No bid 

28 5 Da Rebel Glory  Blk 1 Ran on   NO BID 

 
Heat 9            Result: 1-5-3       Time:   29.54           Distances:      0.50  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
29 1 Gurtnacrehy Post  Faw Ran on 1000 1000 yes 

30 3 Lisroe Poppy  Evaw Finwl 500 500 yes 

31 5 Bangers Vieri  Slaw Finwl 450 450 yes 
 

Heat 10           Result: 1-5-3        Time:  29.62            Distances:   0.75  -  0.75     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 1 Bredas Hondo  Evaw Ranon 700 700 yes 

35 3 Ballybrien Blue  Blk 1 ran on 300 300 yes 

36 5 Lucas Line  Slaw Finwl   No bid 

 
Heat 11           Result:  3-5-1         Time:29.77              Distances:     9  -  0.50 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 1 A rebel Forever  Faw Fad   No bid 

38 3 Tarbert Scholes  Faw Finwl 1500 800 no 

39 5 West Cork Clon  Slaw Ran on 600 350 no 

 
Heat 12           Result:  3-5-1         Time:  29.43          Distances:  6 - 8     
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 Elmpark Magic  Evaw Finwl   No bid 

41 3 Milltown Hero  Faw Ran on 800 800 Yes 

42 5 Soldiers Dream  Evaw Evch   No bid 

 
Heat 13           Result:  3-1-5        Time:    29.48      Distances:     6  -  3   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 1 Ciara Dancer  Evaw Ran on   No bid 

44 3 Finders Fee  Faw Ran on 1000 1000 yes 
45 5 Seomra Preview  Evaw Ran on Not put Up for Sale 

 
Heat 14           Result:   3-5-1        Time:  29.00       Distances:    14 - 7    
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 1 Fancy Dash  Evaw Outp   No bid 

48 3 Brookside Hare  Faw Finwl 4000 2200 no 
51 5 Safa Larkhill  Evaw Outp 1500 700 yes 
 



Heat 15            Result: 3-1-5          Time:29.22      Distances: 13  - 6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

52 1 Ajays Bucko  Evaw Outp   No bid 

53 3 Pale Clover  Faw Ald 1500 1500 yes 

54 5 Seomra Chum  Evaw Outp Not put Up for Sale 

 
Heat 16            Result: 3-1-5         Time:  29.87          Distances: 3 - 4 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
55 1 Chat Show Host  Blk 1 Ran on 800 800 yes 

56 3 Never Regret  Blk 1 Ran on 450 450 yes 

57 5 Big Time Early  Blk 1 Ran on 1000 750 no 
 

Heat 17           Result: 3-1-5         Time:29.61        Distances: 0.50  - 10 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
59 1 Ayle Prince  Blk 1 ran on 2500 1500 yes 

60 3 Violet Pressure  Evaw Finwl   No bid 

61 5 Ballintuber ed  Blk 1 Faded 1000 900 yes 

 
Heat 18           Result: 5-3-1          Time: 29.21         Distances: 4 -12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
62 1 Fairs Pet  Evaw Ran on 300 300 yes 

63 3 Family Sunshine  Faw Ran on 550 550 yes 
64 5 Cragaknock Villa  Faw Ald 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 19           Result: 2 - 4    Time: 29.05         Distances: 12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
65 2 Rockmount Monny  Faw Finwl 2500 1300 no 

50 4 Winnies Vieri  Evaw Outp 850 850 yes 

        
 

Heat 20           Result:          Time: 39.80         Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
66 2 Ashwood Daisy  Finwl   No bid 

        

        
 

Heat 21           Result: 4-2         Time:  16.85                 Distances: 7 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

12 2 Pike Magpie     No bid 

33 4 Cyprus Wacker   450 450 yes 

        

 



Heat 22            Result:               Time:           Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

        

        

        

 
Heat 23            Result:          Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 24           Result:          Time:                     Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 25           Result:                      Time:                    Distances:   
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 26           Result:                     Time:                    Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 27           Result:                     Time:                    Distances:         
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 28           Result:                   Time:                   Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
 



Heat 29            Result:              Time:           Distances:  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        
        

 
Heat 30           Result:               Time:                Distances:         
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        
 

Heat 31           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 32           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 33           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 34           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

 
Heat 35           Result:                 Time:             Distances:        

Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
        

        

        

* No presented for sale 


