
Heat 1            Result: 3-1-5 Time:  29.36 Distances:   8  -  8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

1 1 Chapelane precus  Ran on No bid 100 yes 

2 3 Zip fastener  Faw ald 1650 1650 yes 

3 5 Clonlusk tears  Nvsh No bid  no 

 
Heat 2            Result:  5-3-1  Time:   29.41  Distances:     4  -  10 
Lot   Trap NAME Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

5 1 Lattin credit  Nvsh No bid  no 

6 3 Ocala come on  Ran on 800 400 no 

7 5 Peters kewell  Faw ald 1400 1400 yes 

 
Heat 3            Result: 5 – 1 -3    Time:  29.59   Distances: 2.5  -5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
8 1 Doonbeg mindy  Ran on No bid  no 

11 3 Margos hondo  Faw 400 400 yes 
12 5 Yeneed charm  Finwl 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:   3-5-1         Time:   29.62        Distances:   7 - 2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
13 1 Clonlusk olden  Nvsh 200 200 yes 

14 3 Blossoming blue  Faw ald 600 300 no 

15 5 Lattin joey  Ran on No bid  no 
 

Heat 5            Result:     3-5-1       Time:    29.76     Distances:    2 - 1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 1 Glengar ben  Faw ran on 350 350 yes 

18 3 Glaseen classic  Finwl 500 500 yes 
19 5 Twilight breeze  Faw blk 600 600 yes 

 
Heat 6            Result:1-5-3      Time:29.91    Distances:  1  -  2 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 1 Boherbradda kid  Finwl 550 550 yes 

22 3 Mrs brown  Ran on 300 300 yes 
25 5 Whitehart sailor  Faw faded 400 400 yes 

 
Heat 7            Result:   3-5-1  Time:  29.21   Distances:  7 - 1  
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
26 1 Ferryfortyh gift  Evaw nvsh No bid 100 yes 

27 3 Killcuala brave  Faw ald 3100 3100 yes 

28 5 Appletown homer  Ran on 800 800 yes 

 



Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

29 1 Micks vieri  Slaw ran on 400 400 yes 

30 3 Glengar Shirley  Faw cmg 1000 700 no 

31 5 Nina jo  Evaw ranon 800 800 yes 

 
Heat 9            Result: 3-1-5     Time 29.34      Distances:    2.5  -  1.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
32 1 Cragaknock beta  Faw 2000 900 no 

33 3 Kingston town  Evaw finwl 1500 1500 yes 
35 5 Whitehart Jessie  Ran on 1500 1000 no 

 
Heat 10           Result:  1-5-3    Time   29.07      Distances:   5 - 6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
36 1 Malbay cindy  Faw ald 2750 2750 yes 

37 3 Dessies champion  Outpaced 300 300 yes 

39 5 Glengar celtic  Ran on 1050 1050 yes 

 
Heat 11           Result:   3-5-1     Time:    29.26       Distances:  10  -  10 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
40 1 Gortnaminch top  Evaw outp No bid  no 

41 3 Rathmartin bell  Faw ald 2000 1100 no 

42 5 Edels pride  Ran on No bid  no 

 
Heat 12           Result: 1-5-3        Time  29.05    Distances:   7  -  12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
43 1 Back to toem  Faw finwl 2800 2800 yes 

44 3 Inislosky tagger  Faw outp Not put Up for sale 

45 5 Malbay keano  Evaw ranon 700 700 yes 

 
Heat 13           Result:  3-1 5       Time:  29.32       Distances:       3  -  1 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
46 1 Tally ho victory  Faw faded 1000 600 no 

47 3 Stringers magic  Faw finwl 1800 700 no 

48 5 Best tomato  Evaw ranon No bid  no 
 

Heat 14           Result:      3-1-5    Time:  29.32     Distances:     1-8 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
49 1 Undercover cheri  Faw ld 1 fd 1500 600 no 

50 3 Maxime  Faw finwl 1000 1000 yes 
52 5 Gortnaminch dave  Evaw outp No bid  no 
 
 



Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

53 1 Caseys warrior  Faw ald 2100 2100 yes 

54 3 Kilfinny ben  Slaw ran on No bid  no 

55 5 Ward fifty six  Fin well 600 300 no 

 
Heat 16            Result   1-5-3      Time:  29.56          Distances: 4-7 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
56 1 Tullig bridge  Evaw ald 1600 1600 yes 

57 3 Hurry on  Evaw faded Not put  Up for  sale 

58 5 Scarriff saxa  Evaw finwl 300 300 yes 
 

Heat 17           Result:1-3-5         Time:29.48        Distances: nk  -  0.50 
Lot   Trap Name  Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
59 1 Murphs mentor  Blk 2 finwl 850 850 yes 

60 3 Winnies colonel  Faw fd 650 650 yes 

62 5 Knockananig jack  Blk 2 ran on 450 450 yes 

 
Heat 18           Result:  3-1-5         Time:29.60         Distances: 6-5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
63 1 Bettyville betty  Evaw ran on 450 450 yes 

65 3 Cragaknock lord  Blk 1 ald 1500 600 no 
66 5 Kilfinny gift  Blk 1 No bid  no 

 
Heat 19           Result:5-3-1    Time:28.82         Distances:..10-3 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
67 1 A fresh friend  Out p 500 500 yes 

69 3 Vito scholes  outpaced 450 450 yes 

70 5 Loyal lad  Faw ald 3100 3100 yes 
 

Heat 20           Result1-5-3         Time:29.29  Distances:  7  -  6 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
71 1 Lazy monty  Faw ald 1700 1700 yes 

72 3 Lattin rebel  Evaw outp Not put Up for  sale 

73 5 Drominboy tekapo  Slaw ran on 300 300 yes 
 

Heat    21       Result:3-5-1         Time:29.50       Distances: 0.50  -- 12 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 

74 1 Go your own way  outpaced No bid  no 

75 3 Garrison lass  Evaw finwl No bid  no 

76 5 Sensuous rhythm  Faw faded 800 500 no 

 
 



Heat 22            Result:1-5-3         Time: 29.65 Distances:2.5  -  2.5 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
77 1 Lost in doon  Blk 1 ld 650 650 yes 

78 3 Andrews first  Blk 1 faded 450 450 yes 

51 5 Knocktoosh black  finwl Not put  Up for  sale 

 
Heat 23           Result: 3-1-5 Time16.88:            Distances: 2  - 4  300yds trial 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 1 Katies boss ` Ran on 300 300 yes 

10 3 Axel lad  Faw ald 300 300 yes 

34 5 Reafadda bog  outpaced No bid  no 

 
Heat 24           Result: 4-2    Time: 17.14      Distances:  dist. 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
9 2 Fawn state  outpaced No bid  no 

38 4 Starlight prince  ald No bid  no 
        

 
 


