Heat 1 Result: 6.4 .2 Time: 2@ Distances: 7 -1 V4

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 2 Trim Jewel 3.68 Evaw crd 1 No Bid N

2 4 Sensous Rhythm 3.69 Evawcrd1 €350 Y

3 6 Home Prince 3.64 Evawld1 €1500 Y
Heat 2 Result: 6.4.2 Time: 30.74 Distances: 4 -2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 2 Rathcrea Tina 3.720 Evaw evch €500 Y

5 4 Trim Special 3.69| Evaw evch €600 Y

6 6 Home Millie 3.67 | Faw ald €650 Y

Heat 3 Result: 4.2.6 Time: 31.18 Distances: 9-2%

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 2 Rhytum County 3.69| Evaw evch €500 €300 N

8 4 Smooth Ardmore 3.70| Evawld €300 Y

10 6 Alldashnoswallow 368, Crdlerd3 No Bid N
Heat 4 Result: 2.6.4 Time0.84 Distances: 13 -6

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
11 2 Flaghans Black 3.7 FawlLdl €600 Y

12 4 Coolcholly Ivy 3.84 | Evaw evch NoBid N

13 6 Miss Ardmore 3.69| Faw evch €300 Y
Heat 5 Result: 2.6.4 Time:03%5 Distances: 13-1

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
14 2 Highview Black 3.56| Faw ald €850 Y

15 4 Hanstown Blue 3.62| Slaw ranon No Bid N

16 6 Home Daily 3.62| Fawd®2 €400 Y

Heat 6 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 2B Distances: 2 — 3

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
17 2 Dance Shay 3.62 Crd 1 ran an €1400 Y

19 4 Coolcholly Ivy 3.84| Evawevch 3 €1000 €400 N

20 6 Kirsty County 3.86| Evaw blk 1 €500 Y

Heat 7 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 39 Distances: 2-1

Lot | Trap | Name Split| Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
21 2 Attractive Gem 3.49 Faw ald €1100 Y

22 | 4 Fintans Fire 3.56 Faw &2 €900 Y

23 6 Courthill Vino 3.64| Evaw ranon €650 Y




Heat 8 Result: 6.2.4 Time: 30.76 Distances: 6 -3 %

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
26 2 Atlanta Niamh 3.54| Evaw evch €500 Y

29 4 Fintans Circle 3.65| Faw evch NoBid N

30 6 Brookfield Amigo 3.73| Evawld 3 €1200 Y
Heat 9 Result: 6.2.4 Time: 30.84 Distances: Nk — 3

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
31 2 Hope Rules 3.65| Evaw evch €800 €300 N

34 4 Knockmant Spark 3.63 Crdlranagn €450 Y

35 6 Honest Veri 3.63| Evaw ran on €600 Y
Heat 10 Result: 6.2.4  Time: 30.36 Distances: dist-3

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 2 Star Cash Scobie 3.78 Evawa?2 €300 Y

38 4 Castleland Sue 3.85 Evaw evch NoBid N

41 6 Mystic Mover 3.63| Faw ald €1100 Y
Heat 11 Result:2.6.4 Time:30.64 Distances: 3 - 3

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 2 Kingdom Joy 3.58| Faw ald €1100 €600 N

44 4 Augusta Treasure 3.72  Evaw evch €1000 €30( N
45 6 Knockmant Echo 3.63 Evawrangn €300 Y
Heat 12 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 30 Distances: %2 -9

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 2 Rathcrea Byways 3.65 Evaw ron €350 Y

48 4 Prentsaff Boy 3.60| Faw evch €300 Y

49 6 Will He Rock 3.76 | Slaw nvsh NoBid N
Heat 13 Result:2-6-4 Time: 30.44 Distances: 5-5

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
51 2 Home Gem 3.62| Faw ald €1150 Y

52 4 Wanadoo Bozz 3.6 Fawcrd1l NoBid N

53 6 Skylark Blue 3.83| Evaw evch No Bic N

Heat 14 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 229 Distances: dist - 5

Lot | Trap | Name Split| Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 Cannon Rover 3.62 Faw ald €1850 Y

59 | 4 Dance Ant 3.66 Evaw evch €300 Y

60 |6 Local Voice 3.82 Evaw evch €800 €350 N




Heat 15 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 33 Distances: 1 - 6

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
62 2 Ballalina Bill 3.63 | Faw ald €1400 Y

63 4 Cunning Billy 3.64 | Crd1ranon €850 Y

65 6 West Jewel 3.75] Slaw nvsh NoBid N
Heat 16 Result: 4.2.6 Time: &3 Distances: 1 — 1 %

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
66 2 Straw Nip 3.74| Evaw evch NoBid N

70 4 Colonel Awesome 3.56 Faw ald €750 Y

71 6 West County 3.61| Faw evch NoBid N
Heat 17 Result: 4.2.6 Time:29.94 Distances: 9 - 8

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
73 2 Corriga Be Lucky 3.80| Evaw &2 €400 Y

74 4 Upyaboyya 3.59| Fawald €1600 Y

75 6 Colorado Lisa 3.69| Evaw evch No Bid N
Heat 18 Result: 4.6.2 Time: 3@9 Distances: 3 %2 - nk

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
77 2 Fahy Mentor 3.73| Faw evch No Bid N

79 4 Bigleons Jo 3.73] Fawld 1 No Bid N

80 6 Mur Moon Racer 3.83] Evaw evch No Bid N
Heat 19 Result: 4.6.2 Time: 30.27 Distances:2 - 7

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
82 2 Glanmore Wonder 3.7 Evaw evch €900 Y

83 4 Swinging Nuala 3.64] Evawld1 €800 Y

84 6 Dundrum Classic 3.63 Evaw NoBid N
Heat 20 Result: 2.6.4 Time: 31.27 Distances: 2 -6

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
87 2 Yvonnes Choice 3.69 Faw rnon No Bid N

88 4 Baltard Strand 3.790 Evaw blk 3 NoBid N

89 6 Pass Way 3.93 Evawcrd 3 NoBid N
Heat 21 Result: 6.2.4 Time: 38.9 Distances: 9 -distance

Lot | Trap | Name Split| Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
91 |2 Fosterfield Joe 3.68 Evawcrd 1 NoBid N

92 4 Glanmore Top 359 Fawcrd1l NoBjd N

94 6 Moody Minne 3.74 Evawlid 1 No Bigd N




Heat 22 Result: 2.4 Time: 33 Distances:

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
95 2 Boherbradda Star 3.53 €1100 Y

98 4 Fern River 3.62 No Bid N

Heat 23 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 3.5 Distances: 6 — 7

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
105 | 4 Rosmead Princess 3.69 Evaw evch NoBid N
106 | 6 Derek 3.67| Evawcrd 1 NoBid N

103 | 2 Fathom Lane 3.70 FawlLd1 NoBjd N
Heat 24 Result: 4.2 Time: 34.11 Distances: 6

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
100 | 2 Fairy Line 7.50| Evaw evch No BidN

101 | 4 Springwell Lane 7.36| Faw ald €1000 Y
Heat 25 Result: 4.2.6 Time: 22.85 Distances: 7 —%

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
9 2 Short Shuffle 7.58| Evaw crd ru No Bid N

18 4 Barbie Lady 7.38| Faw ald €1000 €400 N

25 6 Springwell Dash 7.53] Evawcrdry NoBjd N
Heat 26 Result: 2.4.6 Time: 22.38 Distances: 2 — 3 2

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
37 2 Lady Be Lovely 7.35| Fawld 2 €800 Y

39 4 Knockmant Zara 7.35 Evaw evch NoBid N

40 6 Forget It Now 7.30| Fawcrd 1 No Big N
Heat 27 Result: 2.6.4 Time: 22.38 Distances: 1% -5

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
54 2 So Factual 7.19] Faw ald €500 €350 N

64 4 Buffer Zone 7.48| Slaw evch €300 Y

67 6 Spooky Preview 723 Fawcrd 1 NoBid N
Heat 28 Result: 2.4.6 me: 22.42 Distances: % -1 %

Lot | Trap | Name Split| Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
68 2 Swift Marvel 7.18 Faw evch €500 Y

69 4 Joses Hose 724 Crdlranpn €130( €500 N

76 | 6 Scaragh Gypsy 7.36 Evaw evch NoBid N




Heat 29 Result: 2.4.6 Time2.31 Distances: 1 -7

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
78 2 Springwell Storm 7.22| Faw ald €1000 €500

93 4 Baylin Rocket 7.23| Fawranon €550

99 6 Cuckoo Tune 7.38/ Slaw evch No Bid
Heat 30 Result:6.2.4 Tim22.04 Distances: 6 -3

Lot | Trap |Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
90 2 Springwell Honch 7.32| Evaw evch €1000 €300 N
100 | 4 Fairy Penguin 7.29 Evaw crd ] NoBid N

102 | 6 Tornarcy Teak 7.11 Faw ald No Bid N
Heat 31 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 32 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 33 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 34 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
Heat 35 Result: Time: Distances:

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

* No presented for sale



