CORK SALES 24™ JUNE

Heat 1 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.38 Distances : 2L, 8L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
3 2 Malden Bend 3.69 | Evaw, Ald €1,550 | Yes

4 Lochbo Chico 3.70 | Evaw,Stayon 500 No

6 6 Foreign Tour 4.00 | Slow,Ranon €350 | Yes
Heat 2 Result: 2-6-4 Time : 29.72 Distances : 3L 4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
7 2 Kereight Claire 3.70 | Evaw,Styd €500 | Yes

4 Kanturk Lass 3.66 | Bumpl Ranon €300 | Yes

9 6 Spartabritney 3.67 | Blkl Ranon €300 | Yes
Heat 3 Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.27 Distances: 3L, 10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 2 Dusty Blue 3.63 | Evaw.Ranon €400 | Yes

12 4 Leaha Jewel 3.62 | Bump 1 Fd No Bid | No

13 6 Elka Lass 3.61 | Ld2 Styd €1,000 Yes
Heat 4 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.32 Distances: SL.,4L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
15 2 Kereight Homer 3.58 | Evaw,Stydon €250 | Yes

17 4 Spartagina 3.51 | Evaw, Styd €1,550 | Yes

19 6 Sail On Katie 3.56 | Evaw,Ranon No Bid | No
Heat 5 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.29 Distances: 2L,12L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 2 Pama Pearl 3.62 |Ld1, Ald €1,100 | Yes

22 4 Movealong Sailor 3.72 | Evaw,Staydon €900 | Yes

23 6 Smooth Henry 3.84 | Slaw,Neversh * NO
Heat 6 Result: 4-2-6° Time : 28.93 Distances : 6L,10L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
24 2 Pyro 3.59 | Ald,Ranon €1,000 | Yes

25 4 Retail Blitz 3.56 | Ldl,Finwell | 7,000 €4,500 | Yes SOB
26 6 Bridge General 3.71 | Stkrl, Ranon * NO
Heat 7 Result: 4-6-2 Time 29.28 Distances: 8L,2L

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
27 2 Herbs Dream 3.60 | Blk 1 Ranon €500 | Yes

30 4 Where To Now 3.67 | Ld 2 Finwell €1,300 | Yes

31 6 Hi Prince 3.65 | Evaw Fd No Bid | No

* Not Presented for Sale




Heat 8 Result: 4-6-2  Time: 29.36 Distances: 5L,7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
40 2 Fastasthewind 3.66 | Evaw,Fd €200 Yes
33 4 Black Babba (W) 3.53 | Qaw,ALd 1500 €1,200 | Yes SOB
32 6 Wetstone Tom (W) 3.76 | Evaw,Stydon €1,150 | Yes
Heat 9 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.23 Distances: SL,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
44 2 Bridge Missile 3.62 | Evaw,Ranon ® NO
45 4 Free Peach 3.51 | Qaway,Staydon €300 | Yes
46 6 Starcash Pops 3.55 | Ld 2 Staywell | 2,000 800 No
Heat 10 Result: 4-2-6 Time : 29.56 Distances: 2L,3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
49 2 Curryhills Champ 3.63 | Ld1,Hdnrline 800 No
50 4 Kilwylie Mac 3.69 | Blk4 Chlbs 1,100 | No
47 6 Witches Cherry (w) 3.67 | Evaw,Ranon €300 | Yes
Heat 11 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.16 Distances: 5L, 0.5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
51 2 Kingston Gold 3.63 | Ld, Styd Well €1,050 | Yes
53 4 Mayor Ansar 3.69 | Eveaw,stydon | 2,000 800 NO
54 6 Malden Soppano 3.72 | Slaw, Ranon €300 | Yes
Heat 12 Result: 2-4-6 Time: 29.89 Distances: 1L, 3L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
56 2 Georges Hot Drop 3.59 | Blk 1 Stydwell 600 No
57 4 Fivejack Joker 3.55 | Ep,Blk 1 300 | No
55 6 Witches Twinkle 3.76 | Slaw,Ranon * NO
W)
Heat 13 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.20 Distances: 1L,5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
60 2 Bookies Bandit 3.63 | Evaw,Styd 1,750 | No
61 4 Knockrour Paddy 3.57 | RIl, Ld2 €2,600 | Yes SOB
59 6 Roseville Beauty (w) | 3.44 | Ep, Fd €200 | Yes
Heat 14 Result: 4-6-2 Time: 29.13 Distances: 8L, 4L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
55 2 Curryhills Snops 3.65 | Slaw,Rnon
58 4 Canadian Dave 3.45 | Faw,Ald €3,000 | Yes




156 |6 | Serrano Joe (W) 3.50 | Qaw,A2nd 800 | No
* Not Presented for Sale
Heat 15 Result: 4-2-6 Time: 29.01 Distances : 2L,1L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
59 2 Early Contact 3.56 | Evaw,Chlri €2,700 | Yes
61 4 Bearhaven Fox 3.54 | Qaw,Hldon €2,800 | Yes
62 6 Lesotho Promise (W) | 3.48 | Qaw,Mid * No
Heat 16 Result: 6-4-2 Time: 29.00 Distances: 1L,5L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
64 2 Loving Customer 3.58 | Evaw,Rnon * No
65 4 Fouroutoffive 3.49 | Qaw,Chlri 500 No
66 6 Glasha Woods 3.44 | Faw,Ald €3,200 | Yes
Heat 17 Result: 4-2 Time: 29.40 Distances: 7L
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
69 2 Pretty Sunshine 3.51 | Qaw,Rnon €400 | Yes SOB
70 4 Babby Joe 348 | Qaw,Finwl €450 | Yes SOB
6
Heat 18 (330) Result: Solo Time: 18.66 Distances:
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
68 2 Shift Sky Blues No Bid | No
4
6




