
Heat 1            Result: 4-2-6              Time: 29.54                 Distances : 1L,1.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
1 2 Crosssfield Louis 3.49 Faw, Rnon  €900 Yes 

2 4 Duke Egg Blue 3.53 Evaw,Finwl  €1,500 Yes 
3 6 Fleetwood Kerry 3.43 Ld4, Fdri  €1,000 Yes 

 
Heat 2            Result: 4-6-2        Time :  30.06                 Distances :  1.5L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
4 2 Rushing Ballot 3.44 Ld4, Fdri  €350 Yes 

6 4 Effernogue Ash 3.54 Chl4, Styon  €500 Yes 
9 6 Boola Way 3.58 Slaw,Styon  200 No 

 
Heat 3            Result:  2-6-4    Time: 29.64                 Distances:   8L, 2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
10 2 Maldino Baby 3.74 Ld2, Styon  1,100 No 
11 4 Killavoy Girl 3.67 Faw,Crd1  €150  Yes 
13 6 LEaha Breeze 3.84 Slaw,Rnon  €250 Yes 

 
Heat 4            Result:  2-4-6      Time:   29.95    Distances:    2L, 7L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
14 2 Effernogue Kav 3.60 FAw,Ald  €900 Yes 
15 4 Hitman Ali 3.59 CrdRn Rnon  €350 Yes 
16 6 Boola Blossom 3.65 Slaw, Nvshw  * NO 

 
Heat 5            Result: 4-2-6  Time:  29.89 Distances:   2L,1.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
17 2 Ardineer Bess 3.42 Dspld,Fd  €250 Yes 
18 4 Captain Dicaprio 3.45 Dspld, Rnon  €1,800 Yes 
19 6 Galley Cola 3.51 Slaw,Rnon  €200 Yes 

 
Heat 6            Result: 4-6-2   Time : 29.30    Distances : 1L,10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
21 2 Springville Rain 3.68 Evaw,Nvshw  200 No 
22 4 Boher Cash 3.46 Faw,Styon  €1,600 Yes 
24 6 Roseville Breeze 3.47 Faw,Finwl  €1,350 Yes 

 
Heat 7            Result:  6-2-4  Time   29.38   Distances:    3L,5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
27 2 Zabo Prince 3.62 Evaw,Nvshw  €350 Yes 
28 4 Boo Weekley 3.60 Evaw.Rnon  No Bid No 
29 6 Muskerry Bill 3.45 RlRu,Ald  €2,600 Yes 

•  * Not Presented for Sale 
•  

 



Heat 8            Result: 6-2-4 Time: 29.27    Distances:  12L,1.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
30 2 Paulas Star 3.53 Evaw,Rnon  €550 Yes 

31 4 Roseville Penny 3.53 Evaw,Rnon  €350 Yes SOB 
33 6 CoolyKereen Run 3.55 Ld2, Finwl  €2,000 Yes 

 
Heat 9            Result:  2-6-4      Time:  29.53      Distances:    6L,5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
34 2 Bunnys Princess 3.49 Faw,Ald  €850 Yes  
35 4 Lacka Hiker 3.55 Blk 1 Fd  * No 
36 6 Roseville Roary 3.48 Evaw,Rnon  €450 Yes 

 
Heat 10           Result: 2-4-6 Time : 29.94          Distances:   2.5L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
37 2 Trumpers Tiger 3.54 Crdru,ALd  €1,000 Yes 
39 4 Gally Mouse 3.61 Evaw,Rnon  €200 Yes 
40 6 Muskerry Bob 3.57 Slaw,Rnon  €100 Yes 

 
Heat 11           Result: 4-6-2            Time:  29.71    Distances: 0.5L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
41 2 Aldworth View 3.66 Slaw,Mid  €500 Yes 
42 4 Knockrour Ross 3.51 Evaw,styon  €1,500 Yes 
43 6 Go Ellis 3.54 Evaw, Styon  * No 

 
Heat 12           Result:  2-4-6        Time:    30.01         Distances:  9L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
44 2 Effernogue Kenny 3.63 Blk,Styon  €400 Yes 
45 4 Perfect Scholes 3.91 Blk,Rnon  €500 Yes 
46 6 Born High 3.71 Blk,fd  * No 

 
Heat 13           Result: 4-2-6       Time:  29.76         Distances:    7L,1L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
47 2 Trumpers Shark 3.69 Slaw,Rnon  €450 Yes 
48 4 Easter Dolly 3.46 Faw,Ald  €750 Yes  
49 6 Aldworth Jess 3.53 Evaw,Rnon  €200 Yes 

 
Heat 14           Result: 6-4-2                Time:  29.85         Distances:  12L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
50 2 Cloyne Fountain 3.58 Slaw,Rnon  * No 
52 4 Effernogue Laura 3.56 Blk,Rnon  €500 Yes 
53 6 Springville West 3.48 Faw,Ald  €500 Yes 

• Not Presented for Sale 
•  

 



Heat 15            Result: 4-2-6     Time: 29.18 Distances: 9L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
54 2 Volcanic Rock 3.46 Faw,fd  €500 Yes 

55 4 Teds The Job 3.53 Rl1,Styon  €2,700 Yes 
56 6 Travara Maeve 3.56 Evaw,Mid  400 NO 

 
Heat 16       Result: 6-4-2  Time: 29.36  Distances : 2L ,10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
58 2 Effernogue Hazel 3.49 Evaw,Rnon  300 No 
59 6 Queen Bubbles (W) 3.42 Faw,Ald  €1,400 Yes  
61 4 Cloyne Villain 3.56 Evaw,Finwl  300 No 

 
Heat 17           Result: 2-4-6       Time: 29.24            Distances: 2L,12L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
62 2 Volcanic Stone 3.37 Faw,Ald  €2,000 Yes 
63 4 Dicks Game 3.39 Faw,Finwl  €1,150 Yes 
64 6 Effernogue Cat 3.50 Slaw,Nvshw  €250 Yes 

 
Heat 18           Result: 2-4-6          Time:  29.35             Distances : 12L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
66 2 Atlantis Moon 3.42 Faw,Ald  €1,200 Yes 
67 4 Gneevas Tina 3.43 Evaw,Rnon  €300 Yes 
70 6 San Jameos 3.44 Evaw.Rnon  200 NO 

 
Heat 19         Result: 2-4-6 Time  : 28.86    Distances :  6L, 3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
71 2 Loch Bo Boss 3.59 Chl3,Finwl  €4,400 Yes 
74 4 Chadwell Torress 3.42 Ep,Ld 3  €1,000 Yes 
75 6 Oakfront Peppa 3.41 Faw, Rnon  €500 Yes 

 
Heat 20            Result: 4-2-6Time: 29.37  Distances:  4L,2L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
77 6 Brandy Puff (W) 3.53 Evaw,rnon  200 NO 
78 2 Calder Earl 3.48 FAw,Ldbs  800 NO 
79 4 Lochbo Nellie 3.54 Chlbs,Styon  €950 Yes 

 
Heat 21            Result: 2-4-6               Time:  29.13    Distances:  3L,8L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
80 2 Rayhard Hawk 3.45 Faw,Ald 2000 1500 No 

81 4 Maldini Maximo 3.53 Evaw,Finwl  €800 Yes 
82 6 Amys Black 3.51 Evaw,Rnon  * NO 

• Not Presented for Sale 
•  

 



Heat 22            Result: 2-6-4 Time: 30.04     Distances: 1L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
83 2 Upton  Molly 3.50 Ld 1, Rnon  €200 Yes 

84 4 Pretty Clara 3.52 Evaw,Mid  No Bid No 
86 6 Jovial Fox (w) 3.47 Faw,Rnon  €100 Yes 

 
Heat 23         Result: 2-4-6  Time: 29.52    Distances: 2L,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
87 6 Cowboy Johno (W) 3.41 Faw,Rnon  No Bid No 
88 2 Near The Cat 3.42 Faw.Ald  No Bid No 
89 4 Pretty Dancer 3.44 Faw,Rnon  €250 Yes 

 
Heat 24           Result: 2-4-6            Time: 29.51 Distances:  8L ,3L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
90 6 Lady Fleming (W) 3.47 Evaw,Rnon  No Bid No 
91 2 Will Do 3.37 Faw,Ald  No Bid No 
92 4 Elliy Tiger 3.38 Faw, Styon  No Bid No 

 
Heat 25             Result: 4-2-6             Time:29.16           Distances : 3L,0.5L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
93 2 Paddock Pass  Evaw,Rnon  €500 Yes 
94 4 Drompark Suzie 3.37 Faw,ALd  1,100 No 
95 6 Sedate Flyer (w)  Evaw,Rnon  No Bid No 

 
Heat 26            Results : 4-6-2   Time:  29.40                        Distances:    8L , 10L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
97 2 Hursul Billy 3.49 Faw,Fd  * NO 
98 4 Shes A Demon 3.52 Ld 1, Styon  €2,500 Yes 
99 6 Paddock Daddy 3.54 Slaw, Rnon  €500 Yes 

 
Heat 27          Result:  2-6-4                         Time:   29.72                Distances: 1.5L,4L 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
101 2 Spice Top 3.34 Faw,Ald  600 NO 
102 4 Hilight Lemon 3.49 Evan,Rnon  No Bid NO 
103 6 Go Go Lassie 3.56 Slaw,Finwl  * NO 

 
Heat 28                    Result:    4-2               Time:  29.30                Distances:  20 
Lot   Trap Name Split Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N 
104 2 Hursul Sems 3.56 Evaw,A 2nd  * NO 
105 4 Granard Jess 3.42 Faw,Ald  400 NO 
 6       

• Not Presented for Sale 
 


