Heat 1 Result:1-3-5 Time: 29.79 Distances: 1-2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
1 1 Comogue Comet Ep finwl 800 800 yes

2 3 Dart Along Faw Evch 300 300 yes

3 5 Grancott Beauty Evaw ran on 400 400 yes
Heat 2 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.31 Distances: 10 - 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
4 1 Lady Travel On Blk finwl 1900 1900 yes
3 Corcass Pearl Blk ran on 500 200 yes

6 5 Bodens Bark Evaw Outp 200 200 yes
Heat 3 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.32 Distances: 8 -6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N

1 Lubagh Girl Evaw Ranon | 200 200 yes

8 3 Sporting Brett Faw Ald 1800 1800 yes

9 5 Dusty Star Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 4 Result: 1-3-5 Time29.93: Distances: 0.50 - 2.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
10 1 Bodens Gold Faw Ald 450 450 yes

11 3 Mount Ruby Maeve Evaw Chlri 450 450 yes

12 5 Ashill Bertie Slaw W Bend | 200 200 yes
Heat 5 Result: 5-3-1 Time: 29.26 Distances: 10 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
13 1 Guranekeagh Lady Evaw ranon | 500 250 300

17 3 Slow Hawk Evaw ranon | 350 350 yes

14 5 Geneva Kerri Faw ald 3500 2300 yes

Heat 6 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.24 Distances: 10 - 6

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
20 1 Naughty Nighty Slaw nvsh No bid
21 3 Corcass Spark Faw ald 1000 1000 yes

22 5 Scala Lane Slaw finwl No bid
Heat 7 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 29.09 Distances: 5 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
23 1 Angel Tree Slaw outp No bid

24 3 Headleys rogue Faw ald 1600 1600 yes

28 5 Shrulawn Slaw finwl 400 400 yes




Heat 8 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.40 Distances: 3 - 1.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
30 1 Rabbits Maldini Ep Ald 450 450 yes

31 3 Shanakyle Mossie Evaw ranon No bid
32 5 Plums Raven Evaw ranon | 200 200 yes
Heat 9 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.36 Distances: 4 - 4

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
33 1 Corcass Babe Ep ranon 500 500 yes

34 3 Lash Out Evaw ranon No bid

5 Cahirdubh Faw finwl 1600 1600 yes

Heat 10 Result: 1-5-3 Time: 29.30 Distances: nk - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
36 1 Rampant magpie Evaw Finwl | 200 200 yes

37 3 Instant Star Faw outp No bid
38 5 Coolscart blues Rlru Ranon | 4000 1400 no
Heat 11 Result3-5-1 Time: 29.34 Distances: 1.5 - 2

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
39 1 Action Man Evaw ranon | 300 300 yes

41 3 Rabbits rose Faw ald 650 650 yes

40 5 Da bandit Evaw finwl 1000 1000 yes
Heat 12 Result:3-1-5 Time: 29.23 Distances: 6 - 10

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
42 1 Plums Wants Evaw finwl 100 100 yes

45 3 Clonreddan Billy Faw ald 1100 1100 yes

46 5 Blackboy Bell Evaw Outp No bid
Heat 13 Result: 5-1-3 Time: 29.28 Distances: 2 - 0.50

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
47 1 Gers Noble Slaw finwl 450 450 yes

48 3 Oyster Millie Slaw ranon | 450 450 yes

49 5 Malbay Judy Faw ald 1500 700 no

Heat 14 Result: 3-5-1 Time:29.35 Distances:hd - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
50 1 Shes our dream Evaw Outp No bid

51 3 Coolscart State Risru Hld on | 1350 1350 yes

54 |5 Scala Top Faw chlri 700 700 yes




Heat 15

Result: 1-5-3 Time:29.17 Distances: 4 - 8

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
55 1 Clonreddan Magic Evaw finwl 1300 1300 yes

56 3 Jims noble Blk Ran on 200 200 yes

59 5 Philgrams man Blk finwl 500 500 yes
Heat 16 Result: 3-1-5 Time: 29.30 Distances: 2 -=2
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
61 1 Shanakyle Jewel Faw evch 200 2200 Yes

63 3 Gulleen trix Evaw finwl 600 600 yes

64 5 Sunset Joe Evaw ranon 300 300 yes
Heat 17 Result: 5-3-1 Time:29.53 Distances: 1 = 0.50
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
65 1 Creole Flyer Evaw finwl 200 200 yes
67 3 Mals noble Faw evch 350 350 yes
69 5 Caherogan droopy Evaw finwl 1000 1000 yes
Heat 18 Result: 1-3-5 Time: 29.04 Distances: hd - §

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
70 1 Malbay Dermie Ep cmag 3000 1600 no

71 3 Saucy cool Crd 1 Hdnrl | 850 850 yes

75 5 Joes Noble Crd1 Ran on No bid
Heat 19 Result: 1-3-5 Time:29.33 Distances: 1.5 - Dist

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
77 1 Gulleen Star Evaw Finwl | 400 400 yes

78 3 Blueridge Jake Faw ranon 400 400 yes

79 5 Selinas Wish Evaw outp No bid
Heat 20 Result: 3-5-1 Time: 28.45 Distances: 10 = §

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
80 1 Troys Honcho Slaw nvsh Not put Up for sale

81 3 Corran Style Faw ald 1000 700 no

82 5 Tucon Lady Slaw Ran on | 300 300 yes

Heat 21 Result: 2-4  Time: 29.28 Distances: 3

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve | Bid Sold Y/N
83 |2 Rons Magic Crdl Finwl | 1350 1350 yes

84 4 Astronomers star Evaw Crd 1 | 400 400 yes




Heat 22 Result: 2-4 Time: 16.67 Distances: 2.5

Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
57 2 A right Druid Ep Ald 600 450 no
74 4 Peaceful Mood Evaw ran on No bid
THE FOLLOWING GREYHOUNDS RAN ON MONDAY 21" JULY
Lot | Trap | Name Split | Remarks Reserve Bid Sold Y/N
19 FOXWOOD BOSS 1000 1000 YES
52 CLONBONY 500 500 YES
SALLY




